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North Street 
Melbourne Derby DE73 8FZ 

for sale    

£269,950 

Property Description 
 

 

 

  

A traditional two-bedroom semi-detached 
home with off road parking to side and 
substantial two storey barn to the rear, both 
offering potential for extension/development 
subject to planning permission.  The property 
is offered with vacant possession/no chain, 
has a gas fired central heating system, double 
glazing where specified, and briefly 
comprises, to the ground floor: - entrance hall, 
lounge, inner lobby, dining room, kitchen.  To 
the first floor: - two bedrooms and bathroom.  
Outside, a particular feature of the property is 
a large (32.5 feet x 14.2 feet) two storey barn, 
which is suitable for a variety of purposes, was 
used for market gardening, but could also be 
converted into further living accommodation 
subject to planning.  The property also has a 
side driveway providing off road parking for 
several vehicles and a low maintenance 
garden area. 
 
Entrance 
 
Accessed via front UPVC double glazed 
entrance door with opaque double glazed fan 
light over leading to lounge. 
 
Lounge 
 
 11' 1" x 12’ Max into chimney breast recess 
(3.38m x 3.66m Max into chimney breast 
recess) 
having UPVC double glazed window to the 
front elevation with fitted blind, feature 
fireplace incorporating electric coal effect fire 
with timber effect surround, central heating 
radiator with cover over, half glazed door 
giving access to inner lobby. 
  
Inner Lobby 
 
With door giving access to useful understairs 
store. 
 
 
 
 
 

Dining Room 
 
 12’ x 11' 11" Max into chimney breast recess 
(3.66m x 3.63m Max into chimney breast 
recess) 
Having UPVC double glazed window to the 
rear and side elevations with fitted window 
blinds, ornamental opening to the chimney 
breast with quarry tiled flooring and power 
socket, central heating radiator and half 
glazed door giving access to: - 
 
Kitchen 
 
 9' 3" x 6' 1" (2.82m x 1.85m) 
Having a range of matching wall and base 
units with laminate work surfaces over, wall 
mounted boiler providing the property with 
domestic hot water and central heating, 
plumbing and space for automatic washing 
machine, free-standing gas cooker with hob 
and fitted extractor hood, ceramic tiled 
splashbacks, UPVC double glazed window 
and door to the side, ceramic tiled flooring 
and central heating radiator. 
 
First Floor Landing  
 
Having loft access, central heating radiator 
with radiator cover and pine panelled doors 
off to: - 
 
Bedroom One 
 
 12' 1" Max x 11' 6" (3.68m Max x 3.51m) 
Having UPVC double glazed window to the 
front elevation with fitted window blind, corner 
fitted wardrobe, central heating radiator and 
understairs walk-in closet with ladder storage. 
 
Bedroom Two 
 
 11' 11" x 8' 8" Max into chimney breast 
recess (3.63m x 2.64m Max into chimney 
breast recess) 
Having UPVC double glazed window to the 
rear with fitted blind, wardrobe with under 
drawer storage and central heating radiator. 



 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

  

 
Bathroom 
 
Having a three-piece white suite comprising 
of panelled bath with electric shower over and 
shower screen, pedestal wash hand basin 
with ceramic tiled splashback, low level W.C, 
central heating radiator, fitted open shelving, 
vinyl flooring and UPVC double glazed 
opaque window to the side with fitted blind. 
 
Outside 
 
The side of the property is a large, tarmacked 
driveway providing off road parking and 
potential for extension subject to planning 
permission. To the end of the drive is a 
fenced boundary giving privacy and access 
via a timber gate to the rear section of the 
property. 
To the rear is a range of useful outbuildings 
comprising of a timber shed, two storey brick-
built barn and a further shed. The rear is fully 
tarmacked for ease of maintenance. 
 
Barn 
 
Having light and power, UPVC double glazed 
windows to the side, one to the ground floor 
two the first floor. 
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To view this property please contact Ashley Adams on 

 

T 01332 865 568 
E melbourneinfo@ashleyadams.co.uk 
 
39 Market Place Melbourne   

DERBY DE73 8DS 

 

 
 

 

 

 
check out more properties at ashleyadams.co.uk 

EPC Rating: Awaited 

1. MONEY LAUNDERING REGULATIONS Intending purchasers will be asked to produce identification documentation at a later stage and we would ask for your co-operation in order that there will be no delay in agreeing the sale. 2. These particulars do not 
constitute part or all of an offer or contract. 3. The measurements indicated are supplied for guidance only and as such must be considered incorrect. Potential buyers are advised to recheck measurements before committing to any expense. 4. We have not 
tested any apparatus, equipment, fixtures, fittings or services and it is in the buyers interest to check the working condition of any appliances. 
 

Ashley Adams is a trading name of Connells Residential which is registered in England and Wales under company number 1489613, Registered Office is Cumbria House, 16-20 Hockliffe Street, Leighton Buzzard, Bedfordshire, LU7 1GN.  VAT Registration 
Number is 500 2481 05.    

See all our properties at www.ashleyadams.co.uk| www.rightmove.co.uk | www.zoopla.co.uk  Property Ref: MEL204662 - 0003 

Tenure:Freehold  
 


