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Palmerston Court 
Melbourne Derby DE73 8HY 

for sale   offers over 

£450,000 

Property Description 

 

 

  

A stunning three storey four bedroom semi 
detached family home, built in 2004 by a local 
small building firm to a high standard with a 
mix of stone and brick to complement this 
highly desirable central Melbourne location. 
The garden is a blank canvass for prospective 
purchasers to create and plant to their 
requirements and is particularly private  It is a 
light filled house, very close to the centre of 
the village and its amenities but also very 
quiet in its slightly set back location. In brief 
the accommodation comprises:-Entrance hall, 
cloaks/w.c,  lounge, fitted kitchen diner with 
integrated appliances. To the first floor are 
three well proportioned bedrooms, two of 
which have fitted wardrobes and family 
bathroom. To the second floor is the master 
bedroom suite with walk-in-wardrobes and en 
suite shower room. 
This fantastically  located home is nestled to 
the far end of the close, within walking 
distance of all local amenities in Melbourne. 
Boasting a substantial fore garden with 
recently installed low level fencing and gate 
access that leads you to the beautiful stone 
facade side facing entrance porch and rear 
garden via a gated entrance.  The front 
garden is mainly laid to lawn with paved 
pathway, dedicated bin store behind. To the 
rear is a substantial fully fenced private rear 
garden with patio, the property also benefits 
from outside lighting and a water tap to the 
rear garden.  To the front is a detached brick 
and slate garage with side width parking for 
two cars.  
 
Entrance Hall 
 
Via a timber cottage style front door with 
framed frosted glazed windows to each side, 
you are welcomed into a light and spacious 
hallway with elevated pitched ceiling with 
exposed timber beams and feature wall light 
and two radiators, which leads you to a 
cloakroom, lounge and dining kitchen and 
staircase to the first floor. 
 
Cloakroom 
 

The cloakroom sits to the front elevation of 
the property. With ceramic tiled flooring, low 
level w.c, pedestal wash hand basin with 
chrome mixer tap over, radiator, distorted 
double glazed timber window to the front 
aspect, and a range of fitted matching 
cupboards for extra storage and housing the 
fuse board.  
  
Lounge 
 14' 6" x 13' 10" into chimney recess ( 4.42m x 
4.22m into chimney recess ) 
With two timber double glazed sash windows 
to the front aspect, radiator, feature wall 
lights, inset spotligts. With a central  feature 
Marble hearth & mantle  gas fire.  
 
Kitchen / Diner  
 12' 2" into entrance recess x 21' 3" ( 3.71m 
into entrance recess x 6.48m ) 
U shaped fully fitted solid timber shaker style 
kitchen in a range of drawer line base units 
and matching wall units (housing the boiler).  
With ceramic tiled floor and tiled splashback, 
laminate worktop and stainless steel 1 1/4 
sink and drainer. Integrated appliances 
include; Blomberg dishwasher, Indesit 
washing machine, Bosch fridge, Bosch 
freezer, Bosch tumble dryer, Bosch electric 
oven, five ring gas hob with stainless steel 
chimney hood extractor. A timber double 
glazed window to the rear aspect with double 
glazed timber French doors leading to the 
rear patio and garden. With inset spotlights, 
radiator.  
 
First Floor Landing 
 
Spacious and bright landing with window to 
the front elevation and low level fitted corner 
storage cupboard. With timber balustrade, 
radiator, the landing leads to bedrooms 2,3 & 
4, family bathroom and second staircase to 
the second floor. 
 
Bedroom Two 
 14' 1" into wardrobes x 10' 3" ( 4.29m into 
wardrobes x 3.12m ) 



 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

  

shower enclosure with electric shower, low 
level wc and fitted vanity unit with fitted wash 
stand with chrome mixer tap over, storage 
cupboard and laminate top.  
 
Outside  
 
This fantastically located home is nestled to 
the far end of the close, within walking 
distance of all local amenities. Boasting a 
substantial fore garden with recently installed 
low level fencing and gate access that leads 
you to the beautiful stone facade side facing 
entrance porch and garden via a gated 
entrance.  The front garden is mainly laid to 
grass and bin store nestled behind the fence.  
To the rear is a substantial fully fenced private 
rear garden with patio, the property also 
benefits from outside lighting and a water tap 
to the rear garden.  To the front is a detached 
brick and slate garage with side width parking 
for two cars.  
 
Detached Garage 
 
Located to the front of the property on 
approach to the left hand side is a detached 
single brick and slate roofed garage.  The 
garage has a timber up and over door, 
extensive eaves space for storage , light, 
power and window to the north side.  
 

Substantial double bedroom with fitted 
wardrobes, with radiator and double glazed 
timber window to the rear elevation.  
 
Bedroom Three 
 13' 11" into wardrobes x 7' 9" ( 4.24m into 
wardrobes x 2.36m ) 
To the front of the property offers bedroom 
three, with front elevation timber double 
glazed window, radiator and four fitted 
wardrobes and shelving unit.  
 
Bedroom Four 
 12' 1" x 6' 11" ( 3.68m x 2.11m ) 
The fourth bedroom sits to the rear of the 
property with timber double glazed window to 
the rear aspect overlooking the garden.  
 
Family Bathroom 
 10' 1" x 6' 5" ( 3.07m x 1.96m ) 
A well appointed modern four piece bathroom 
suite, with panelled bath fitted chrome mixer 
tap and shower attachment, tastefully fitted 
vanity unit with inset basin with chrome mixer 
tap over and below cupboard storage,  
laminate worktop over, the vanity unit 
continues to house a hidden low level WC 
cistern. With fully enclosed glazed shower 
cubical that has been fully tiled and chrome 
thermostatic shower which offers instant hot 
water from the central heating system. The 
bathroom has ceramic tiled flooring, with 
matching wall tiles for splashback and shower 
enclosure. With timber distorted glazed 
window to the side elevation.  
 
Second Floor Landing 
 
Giving access to the master bedroom and 
shower room/en-suite. 
 
Master Bedroom  
 14'  x 15'  pitched ceiling ( 4.27m x 4.57m 
pitched ceiling ) 
A grand master bedroom with roof window to 
rear elevation and double glazed timber 
window to side elevation, two radiators and 
walk in storage cupboard / wardrobe.  
 
Shower Room / En-Suite 
 
Modern shower room with ceramic tiled 
flooring, part tiled walls including fully tiled 
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To view this property please contact Ashley Adams on 

 

T 01332 865 568 
E melbourneinfo@ashleyadams.co.uk 
 
39 Market Place Melbourne   

DERBY DE73 8DS 

 

 
 

 

 

 
view this property online  ashleyadams.co.uk/Property/MEL204893 

EPC Rating: C 

1. MONEY LAUNDERING REGULATIONS Intending purchasers will be asked to produce identification documentation at a later stage and we would ask for your co-operation in order that there will be no delay in agreeing the sale. 2. These particulars do not 
constitute part or all of an offer or contract. 3. The measurements indicated are supplied for guidance only and as such must be considered incorrect. Potential buyers are advised to recheck measurements before committing to any expense. 4. We have not 
tested any apparatus, equipment, fixtures, fittings or services and it is in the buyers interest to check the working condition of any appliances. 
 

Ashley Adams is a trading name of Connells Residential which is registered in England and Wales under company number 1489613, Registered Office is Cumbria House, 16-20 Hockliffe Street, Leighton Buzzard, Bedfordshire, LU7 1GN.  VAT Registration 
Number is 500 2481 05.    

See all our properties at www.ashleyadams.co.uk| www.rightmove.co.uk | www.zoopla.co.uk  Property Ref: MEL204893 - 0011 

Tenure:Freehold  
 


