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Offers in the region of £210,000
Council Tax Band: B

Located in the charming Cockerton area of Darlington, this larger than average semi-detached property presents an excellent opportunity for families
and individuals alike. With three well-proportioned bedrooms and a thoughtfully designed bathroom featuring a four-piece suite, including both a bath and
shower, this property is beautifully presented and ready for you to make it your own.

The heart of the home is undoubtedly the spacious
dining kitchen, which invites warmth and comfort,
making it the perfect space for family gatherings or
entertaining friends. The cosy lounge, adorned with
a delightful bay window, offers a great retreat to
unwind after a long day.

One of the standout features of this property is the
generous split-level south-facing garden, which
boasts a peaceful decked area accessible directly
from the dining kitchen. This outdoor space is ideal
for enjoying sunny afternoons or hosting summer
barbecues. Additionally, the property benefits from a
basement that offers excellent potential for future
development, whether you envision a playroom,
home office, or additional storage space. The house
is equipped with UPVC double glazing and gas
central heating via a Baxi 800 boiler, ensuring
comfort and efficiency throughout the seasons.

Situated in the desirable area, this home is
conveniently located within walking distance to local
shops in Cockerton Village, the town centre, and
easy access to the A1(M) & A66 for those
commuting. Priced competitively in today’s market,
this property is a must-see, with early viewings
strongly recommended to fully appreciate all that this
lovely home has to offer.

Please note:
Council tax Band - B
Tenure - Freehold
Total sq ft and room dimensions to be considered a
guide only.

Estates 'The Art of Property'
Professional Estate Agents, selling homes across
Darlington, Newton Aycliffe, Teesside & North
Yorkshire with creative & inviting marketing
strategies! Property appraisals available 7 days a
week! 

Disclaimer:
These particulars have been prepared in good faith
by the selling agent in conjunction with the vendor(s)
with the intention of providing a fair and accurate
guide to the property. They do not constitute or form
part of an offer or contract nor may they be regarded
as representations, all interested parties must
themselves verify their accuracy. No tests or checks
have been carried out in respect of heating,
plumbing, electric installations, or any type of
appliances which may be included. All photos,
videos, and marketing material created by Estates
'The Art of Property', are the property of our agency
and are protected by copyright law. Our marketing
material must not be copied, reproduced, shared, or
used in any way without our prior written permission.
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