


20 Frensham Road,
Guide Price £585,000 4 1 3



Introducing this rarely available family home on Frensham Road, 
Kenley. This semi-detached house boasts four bedrooms, a kitchen/
diner, conservatory, landscaped garden, and a loft conversion - 
providing ample space for a growing family.

Located in a popular residential area, this property offers 
convenience and accessibility. With Kenley Station just a stone's 
throw away, commute to Croydon, London Bridge, and London 
Victoria couldn't be easier. In addition, local shops, bus services, and 
a variety of schools cater to the needs of families with children of all 
ages.

Not to mention, the property's proximity to Junction 5 of the M25 
orbital motorway at Godstone ensures quick access to Gatwick and 
Heathrow Airports, the South Coast, and beyond.

This well-maintained home presents the perfect opportunity for 
buyers seeking a comfortable living space in a desirable location. Do 
not miss out on the chance to view this property. Contact us today to 
arrange a viewing.

LOCATION:  The property is located in a popular residential location 
within close proximity of Kenley Station(with regular and direct 
services to Croydon, London Bridge and London Victoria), local 
shops and bus services. The area is well served with schools for 
children of all age groups. Junction 5 of the M25 orbital motorway is 
at Godstone which is about 5 miles away giving easy access to 
Gatwick and Heathrow Airports, the South Coast and the remainder 
of the motorway network.



• 4 Bedrooms

• Landscaped Garden

• Conservatory

• Garden Gazibo

• COUNCIL TAX BAND - E

• Kitchen/Diner

• Loft Conversion

• Gas Central Heating

• EPC - D


