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Set in the highly sought-after area of Gibbet Hill, Coventry, this
stunning detached house offers an exceptional living experience.
With its prime location, the property is conveniently situated near
Warwick University and boasts excellent road links to both
Coventry and Kenilworth, making it ideal for families, professionals
and commuters.

This impressive home features five spacious double bedrooms, three
of which are complemented by en-suite bathrooms, ensuring
comfort and privacy for all family members. The modern family
bathroom adds to the convenience of this well-appointed home. The
heart of the house is undoubtedly the superb kitchen diner,
designed to be a welcoming hub for family gatherings and
entertaining guests. In addition, the property includes a family room,
a lounge, and a study, providing ample space for relaxation and
productivity.

The beautifully presented interiors extend to the master bedroom,
which boasts a dressing room and an en-suite bathroom, creating a
luxurious retreat. The property is further enhanced by a double
garage, offering practical storage solutions.

Step outside to discover a landscaped rear garden, perfect for
outdoor enjoyment. The garden room, complete with a W/C,
presents an excellent opportunity for a home office or gym,
catering to modern lifestyle needs.

This remarkable home in Cryfield Heights is a rare find, combining
spacious living, modern amenities, and a desirable location. It is an
ideal choice for those seeking a family home in one of Coventry's
most popular areas.

£2,995 PCM







shortland-horne.co.uk

Dimensions

Ground Floor

Entrance Hall

Kitchen/Dining Room
8.21 x 4.15

Utility Room

Family Room
4.42 x 3.66

Lounge
5.64 x 3.54

Study
3.55 x 3.44

W/C

First Floor

Master Bedroom
4.44 x 3.53

Dressing Room

En Suite

Bedroom 2
4.27 x 3.86

En Suite

Bedroom 3
4.73 x 4.25

En Suite

Bedroom 4
3.31 x 2.74

Bedroom 5
3.86 x 2.73

Family Bathroom

Externals

Garden Room
3.54 x 3.45

W/C

Storage

Double Garage
5.65 x 5.20
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