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A Rare Opportunity in the Heart of Stretton-on-Dunsmore

A fantastic opportunity to acquire The Old Dairy, a unique and beautifully presented
split-level residence that has been thoughtfully extended and upgraded to an
exceptional standard throughout. Set in the highly desirable village of Stretton-on-
Dunsmore—renowned for its charming community, excellent local amenities, and well-
regarded schools—this home offers the perfect setting for families and retirees alike.

Having undergone extensive renovation in recent years, this spacious detached
property features three generously sized double bedrooms and a fully self-contained
annex, ideal for multi-generational living or guest accommodation.

Accommodation Overview:

The main entrance opens into a welcoming hallway with a guest WC and storage
cupboard. A striking open-plan dining hall leads to a spacious living room with a
feature fireplace and stunning rear views. The modern, fully fitted kitchen includes
integrated appliances, while the stylish family bathroom offers both a bathtub and
double shower.

The three double bedrooms include a luxurious master suite with its own en-suite
shower room and private balcony overlooking the rear garden.

On the lower level—accessible from the dining hall—you’ll find a versatile lobby area,
laundry/ironing room, garden storage, a study, a shower room with WC, and the self-
contained annex. The annex enjoys its own private entrance and includes a
kitchenette/utility area and a large bedroom/living space with views across the garden.

Outside:

The property is set on a substantial and beautifully landscaped plot, accessed via a
widening driveway with gated entrance. Ample parking is available, along with well-
maintained lawns, mature trees, planting beds, and a charming outdoor entertaining
area. A picturesque stream runs through the garden, adding to the idyllic countryside
setting.

LOCATION

Stretton-on-Dunsmore is a charming, historic village in Warwickshire, ideally situated
just off the A45 (London Road) and the B4455 (Fosse Way). The location offers excellent
connectivity to nearby towns, including Leamington Spa, and is close to neighbouring
villages such as Ryton-on-Dunsmore, Princethorpe, Frankton, Bourton-on-Dunsmore,
and Wolston.

The village boasts a wide range of amenities, including the popular public house The
Oak and Black Dog, a well-regarded doctor’s surgery with dispensary, and Knightlow
Primary School—rated Outstanding by Ofsted—which also offers pre-school and after-
school clubs. There is also a dedicated nursery for younger children.

Other local highlights include a well-stocked village shop, a beautiful church, and a
lively village hall that hosts a variety of community activities such as playgroups, Cubs,
Scouts, and theatre groups—reflecting the area’s strong community spirit.

Public transport is readily available, with an excellent bus service from the village
centre—just a short walk from the property—offering convenient routes to
Leamington Spa, Rugby, and Coventry.
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Dimensions

GROUND FLOOR

Entrance Hallway

Dining Room
5.16m x 4.60m

W/C

Kitchen
4.50m x 3.68m

Living Room
5.82m x 4.06m

Balcony

Bedroom
4.09m x 2.13m

Bedroom
3.58m x 2.74m

Bedroom
4.62m x 3.61m

En-Suite

Bathroom
2.87m x 2.34m

LOWER GROUND
FLOOR

Study
2.06m x 1.83m

Utility Room

Sitting Room
5.69m x 2.49m

Store Rooms

Shower Room



Floor Plan Location Map

EPC

Total area: 1915.00 sq ft
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