
Bennetts Road North 
Corley CV7 8BG



Bennetts Road North
CV7 8BG

Welcome to Peace Haven, a charming semi-detached house located on
Bennetts Road North in the tranquil village of Corley, Coventry. This
beautifully renovated property offers a perfect blend of modern living
and serene surroundings, making it an ideal choice for first-time
buyers or those seeking a peaceful retreat.

As you approach the property, you will be greeted by a spacious
tarmac driveway that accommodates multiple vehicles, complemented
by a well-maintained forelawn. The side passage provides convenient
access to the expansive rear garden, a true highlight of this home.

Upon entering, you are welcomed by an inviting entrance hallway that
leads to an open-plan lounge and dining area. The lounge, adorned
with stylish grey laminate flooring, features a large window that fills
the space with natural light and a cosy log burner with an oak
mantle beam, perfect for those chilly evenings. The adjoining dining
area is generously sized, ideal for family gatherings and entertaining.

The modern kitchen, located at the rear of the property, boasts fitted
base units, an integrated induction hob and oven, and ample space for
additional appliances. With its tiled flooring and direct access to the
rear garden, this kitchen is both functional and stylish.

Upstairs, you will find two well-proportioned double bedrooms, both
carpeted for comfort. The master bedroom overlooks the front of the
house, while the second bedroom enjoys views of the rear garden. The
contemporary family bathroom is a luxurious retreat, featuring a
stunning freestanding bath, wash hand basin, and toilet, all enhanced
by elegant black tiled splashbacks.

The rear garden is a true gem, measuring approximately 200ft in
length. It offers a delightful patio seating area, perfect for al fresco
dining, alongside well-maintained lawn space and shed bases, providing
ample storage options.

Peace Haven is not only a beautifully presented home but also
conveniently located for easy access to the M6 motorway
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Dimensions

GROUND FLOOR

Entrance Hallway

Lounge/Dining Room
6.53m x 3.63m

Kitchen
4.52m x 2.87m

Shower

FIRST FLOOR

Bedroom One
4.29m x 3.35m

Bedroom Two
3.02m x 2.74m

Shower Room



Floor Plan Location Map

EPC

Total area: 765.00 sq ft

02476 222 123

lettings@shortland-horne.co.uk
shortland-horne.co.uk

@ShortlandHorne

Shortland-Horne


