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Middlemarch Road
CV6 3GE
* SUBSTANTIALLY EXTENDED DOUBLE CIRCULAR
STONE BAYED END TERRACE * PROMINENT CORNER
POSITION * TWO STOREY REAR & SINGLE STOREY SIDE
EXTENSION * 5 BEDROOMS & 2 BATHROOMS *DIRECT
SIDE ACCESS TO BRICK GARAGE & ADDITIONAL CAR
PARKING TO THE FRONT & REAR GARDEN * VIEWING
HIGHLY RECOMMENDED

Situated on a prominent corner position with Lanchester Road,
this substantially Extended 5-bedroom Double circular stone
bayed Halls Together end of terraced house is a true gem
waiting to be discovered. Boasting not just one, but two
reception rooms and two bathrooms, this property offers ample
space for a growing family.

What sets this property apart is its substantial extension with
a two storey rear extension as well as a single storey side
extension providing generous family accommodation that is
perfect for modern living. The side extension offers a versatile
space that can be used as a teenage retreat or a comfortable
living area for elderly relatives, ensuring that everyone in the
family has their own space to relax and unwind.

In addition to the delightful living spaces, this property
features direct side access to a larger than average brick
garage with electric shutters, ideal for storing your vehicles or
creating a workshop for your hobbies with ample additional
car parking available both at the front and rear gardens. You'll
never have to worry about finding a spot for your guests! 

Don't miss the opportunity to make this gas fired centrally
heated and double glazed property your home and enjoy the
convenience of a well-designed layout, versatile living spaces,
and the potential to create lasting memories in this wonderful
property.







shortland-horne.co.uk

Dimensions

ENTRANCE HALL

BAY WINDOWED
THROUGH LOUNGE
6.96 x 3.53

EXTENDED FITTED
KITCHEN
6.87 x 1.95

SITTING/ DINING
ROOM
4.20 x 2.86

FAMILY ROOM /
BEDROOM
6.26 x 2.70

STUDY
2.70 x 2.46

FULLY TILED
BATHROOM WITH
SHOWER

LANDING

DRESSING WALKWAY

BEDROOM ONE
3.50 x 3.34

BEDROOM TWO
3.35 x 3.32

BEDROOM THREE
3.20 x 2.43

BEDROOM FOUR
2.20 x 1.82

FULLY TILED
SHOWER ROOM

LANDING TO
BEDROOM FIVE
5.10 x 3.94

DIRECT SIDE ACCESS
TO BRICK BUILT
GARAGE
5.48 x 4.21

DIRECT ACCESS
DOUBLE CAR
PARKING

AMPLE ADDITIONAL
CAR PARKING IN THE
REAR GARDEN

VIEWING HIGHLY
RECOMMENDED
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