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Exminster Road
CV3 5NY

EXTENDED BUNGALOW POSITIONED ON A REALLY
GOOD PLOT!!

This two/three bedroom detached bungalow is located on an
excellent sized corner plot and situated in the popular
residential area of Exminster road, Styvechale. 
Exminster Road is positioned close to excellent road links with
quick access to A46 to Warwick and the A45 which provides
quick access to get to both the south or north of the city. The
house is close to local amenities and has a bus route close by
and is positioned within easy reach of the War Memorial Park.

The property offers a welcoming entrance hallway with doors
leading off to a Kitchen/Breakfast room, a spacious sitting room
and an extended lounge which could easily be used as a third
bedroom should the new occupiers require a further bedroom.
There are two double bedrooms and two bathrooms making
this really comfortable to live in. 

Outside the current owners have built a sheltered patio to enjoy
all year round, the lawn and further patio wraps around this
delightful property. The front provides lots of parking
opportunities on a block paved driveway and access to single
garage. 

The property stands on an excellent plot size which benefits
from double glazing, gas central heating.

Viewings strictly by appointment through Shortland Horne to
truly understand the excellent opportunities this property brings
to potential buyers.







shortland-horne.co.uk

Dimensions

GROUND FLOOR

Entrance Hallway

Kitche/Breakfast Room
5.03m x 2.72m

Sitting Room
4.24m x 4.06m

Bedroom
3.81m x 2.74m

Bathroom

Bedroom
4.19m x 3.66m

Bathroom

Extended Lounge
5.33m x 3.63m

Covered Patio
4.09m x 4.09m

OUTSIDE

Garage
5.51m x 2.62m



Floor Plan Location Map

EPC

Total area: 1190.00 sq ft
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