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Stunning property located in the sought-
after area of Walton Park in Milton Keynes.
This delightful detached house boasts a
spacious interior providing ample space
for comfortable living.

One of the standout features of this
property is its extension, offering
additional living space and enhancing the
overall charm of the house. The bi-folding
doors not only bring in an abundance of
natural light but also seamlessly connect
the indoor and outdoor areas, perfect for
entertaining guests or enjoying a peaceful
evening in the garden.

Situated in the Walton High catchment
area, this home is ideal for families looking
to benefit from excellent educational
opportunities. Additionally, being local to
Caldecotte Lake, residents can enjoy
picturesque walks and outdoor activities
right on their doorstep.

If you are looking for a property that
combines modern living with a touch of
elegance, then Pyxe Court is the perfect
choice. Don't miss the opportunity to
make this beautiful house your new home.

• Off Road Parking

• Utility

• En-suite

• Private Rear garden

• Single garage

• Extended

Entrance
2'10" x 2'8"

Entrance Hall
14'4" x 8'10"

Lounge
17'10" x 11'7"

Kitchen/Diner
21'7" x 16'4"

Utility
7'6" x 4'6"

Cloakroom
6'8" x 4'6"

Study
11'6" x 6'6"

Landing

Bedroom 1
17'4" x 11'7"
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Bedroom 2
9'6" x 6'11"

Bedroom 3
10'5" x 8'1"

Bedroom 4
6'10" x 6'6"

En-suite
7'3" x 2'11"

Bathroom
7'2" x 6'9"

Balcony

Garage
28'2" x 7'4"
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