
10 Kensington Gardens, Bedford, MK40 3FH



• Council Tax Band D
• Energy Efficiency Rating B

10 Kensington Gardens 
Bedford
MK40 3FH 

Price £490,000 

Very well maintained and 
individual town house...

Townhouse

Rarely available opportunity 

Cloakroom

Living/dining room

Kitchen/breakfast room

Three bedrooms

Two bath/shower rooms

Gas central heating

Two parking spaces

Own private garden

No chain

Freehold



Set within a unique gated development 
comprising a mix of converted and new build 
homes, this three storey town house has the 
advantage of a very central location. It is within 
close proximity to the town centre and 
therefore has numerous facilities close by with 
the mainline railway station also being within 
easy reach.

The property is offered in excellent order and 
offers beautiful oak finishes, tiling and décor. 
The ground floor includes a very spacious 
living/dining room and a modern 
kitchen/breakfast room with both these rooms 
having sliding doors to the garden.

Moving to the first floor, there are two double 
bedrooms which both have fitted storage and 
Juliet balconies and use of the family 
bathroom.
 

Located in a unique gated development on 
the edge of the popular Castle Road area...
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Occupying the second floor there is a very 
impressive master bedroom suite with eaves 
storage and en suite shower room.

Other benefits include a ground floor 
cloakroom, high performance double glazing 
and gas fired central heating – serving both 
underfloor and radiator heating.

The property has two dedicated parking 
spaces and to the rear, the south facing 
garden offers a range of shrubs and plants. 
The property sits within well maintained 
grounds, with an annual maintenance charge 
of £655.

This home could easily suit a family, 
downsizers or even those looking for a “lock 
up and leave”. There is no onward chain.

Kensington Gardens sits on the edge of the 
popular Castle Road area, which offers a host 
of amenities of its own, in addition to those in 
the town centre. Russell Park and the 
Embankment for riverside walks are also 
readily accessible.
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