
34 Deep Spinney, Biddenham, Bedford, MK40 4QH



Attractive family home offered 
with no upward chain...

34 Deep Spinney
Biddenham
Bedford
MK40 4QH

Price £425,000

•    Council Tax Band F
•    Energy Efficiency Rating D

Sought after location

Detached home

Living room

Dining room

Kitchen and utility room

Four bedrooms

Family bathroom and en suite

Attractive gardens

Single garage and driveway

No chain

Freehold



We are delighted to offer for sale this well 
presented four-bedroom detached home in 
Biddenham, just two miles from Bedford’s 
mainline train station.

The ground floor offers a spacious living room 
that leads through to a separate dining room 
providing access to the beautifully landscaped 
garden. The fitted kitchen is to the rear of the 
property along with a spacious utility room.

On the first floor there are four bedrooms with 
the largest offering fitted wardrobes and an en 
suite shower room and three further spacious 
bedrooms. There is also a family bathroom.

Externally, the private garden is mostly laid to 
lawn with some block paving for dining and a 
side access to the front and a single garage 
which boasts an electric door.

Located in a prosperous and sought after 
village to the west of Bedford...
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The driveway offers ample parking and there 
is an attractive front garden with an array of 
mature bushes.

Added benefits include a ground floor 
cloakroom, gas central heating and double 
glazing.

Scope exists for extension, subject to any 
necessary consents.

Biddenham lies just to the west of Bedford 
and is the closest village to the town being just 
two miles from Bedford’s mainline railway 
station offering fast and frequent services, 
from 41 minutes, to the city and beyond. 
Biddenham is ideally located to take 
advantage of Bedford’s link to the A421 that 
connects the M1 at Junction 13 with the A1 at 
the Black Cat roundabout.

Biddenham is a prosperous village with three 
schools and a Public House. The Biddenham 
Pavilion in the centre of the village offers a 
wide range of opportunities both sporting and 
social to include two hard tennis courts.
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