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             Price £350,000 

Douglas Drive is nestled in a quiet, sought-after residential 
location in the heart of Plymstock. This spacious two-bedroom 
detached bungalow was built by the renowned Fletcher family 
in the 1960’s and offers flexible accommodation that could be 
re-configured should a purchaser wish to convert to a three-
bedroom bungalow. 
 
The bungalow features a spacious and light-filled south facing 
lounge with patio doors leading onto a balcony. The 
kitchen/diner has a range of fitted units and space for a range 
cooker. Both generously sized bedrooms offer ample storage, 
with the main benefiting from built-in wardrobes. There is a 
modern shower room and separate WC. Stairs from the 
entrance hall lead to the garage and utility below.  
 
Outside, the property boasts a generous size rear garden 
offering a private space, and tranquil space to enjoy the 
outdoors. A driveway to the front provides off-road parking for 
numerous vehicles, and a single garage offers additional 
storage space or potential for further use. 
 
This property is within easy reach of local shops, and excellent 
transport links, making it an ideal choice for those looking to 
enjoy a quiet yet connected location. 
 
This charming bungalow offers a wonderful opportunity for 
potential purchasers. The property does require some updating 
but offers comfortable living space in a desirable location.  

To view this property call Lang Town & Country Estate Agents on 01752 456000 
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Lang Town & Country endeavour to ensure the accuracy of property details produced 

and displayed, we have not tested any apparatus, equipment, fixtures, f ittings or 

services and so cannot verify that they are connected, in working order or f it for 

purpose. A buyer must check the availability of any property and make an appointment 

to view before embarking on any journey to see a property .  
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