
Hazel Avenue, Evesham, WR11 1XT



*** AVAILABLE MID JUNE - DEPOSIT
ALTERNATIVE AVAILABLE *** A two
bedroom semi detached house on the
outskirts of Evesham. Evesham is a busy
market town with good road and rail
links, there are a number of super
markets, cafes and restaurants along
with the River Avon and parks. The
accommodation briefly comprises of,
living room, kitchen with a range of
fitted units including spaces for fridge
freezer, dishwasher and washing
machine. Stairs elevate to first floor
landing with one double and one single
bedroom, bathroom with full suite
including shower over bath. Outside is
ample driveway parking and a rear
garden. The property is offered
UNFURNISHED. Council Tax Band B.
Energy Rating D. Initial 12 Month
Tenancy.

Property Description





Key Features

• AVAILABLE MID JUNE -
DEPOSIT ALTERNATIVE
AVAILABLE

• Evesham

• 2 Bedrooms

• Semi Detached House

• Unfurnished

• Rear Garden

• Ample Driveway Parking

• Council Tax Band B

• Energy Rating C

• Initial 12 Month Tenancy

£895 PCM


