
Drodges Close, Bramley, Surrey





Property Description

Council tax band: C; Tenure: Freehold; EPC rating: C. 

Brought to the market with no onward chain, this enhanced and
extended semi-detached house is nestled in a semi-rural location, just a
short walk from Bramley Village Cricket Green. It offers well-proportioned
accommodation and a spacious private garden.

The main living area boasts a bright, open-plan kitchen and dining space
with direct views of and access to the garden. A separate sitting room
offers a relaxing retreat from the heart of the home. The top two floors
feature four bedrooms, including a master suite on the second floor with
an ensuite shower room, while a contemporary family bathroom serves
the remaining bedrooms.

Outside, a garage and driveway with an EV wall charger offer ample
parking and storage. The generously sized rear garden and patio provide
an ideal space for outdoor entertaining and enjoyment.

Bramley enjoys a vibrant local community spirit along with its thriving
high street where a fine local butcher, grocer, supermarket, coffee shop,
and post office can be found. There are two popular pubs as well as a
library and historic church. The village has regular bus links to Guildford,
Godalming, and Cranleigh. There is an excellent selection of schools in
the area in both the state and private sectors, including St.Catherine’s
School for Girls.

Guildford is approximately two miles away and has an extensive range of
shopping and leisure facilities including the cinema complex, Yvonne
Arnaud Theatre, G Live, the Surrey Sports Park and Spectrum Leisure
Centre. Guildford mainline station provides a fast and regular service to
London Waterloo in approximately 35 minutes. There is a good road
network and the A3 gives access to London, the M25 and the national
motorway network, Heathrow and Gatwick.

Guide Price: £695,000








