
Rutland Lodge 14 Rutland Lane, Bottesford,
Leicestershire, NG13 0DG O.I.R.O £850,000

Tel: 01949 836678



We have pleasure in offering to the market this beautifully
presented and well proportioned, detached, family
orientated home which benefits from a delightful
backwater location, tucked away off a private driveway
with electric gate access and a pleasant southerly rear
aspect across to adjacent paddocks. 

The property offers a versatile and well proportioned level
of accommodation which approaches 2,500 sq.ft. plus
integral garage. The property has been tasteful ly
modernised throughout with contemporary fixtures and
fittings including a range of floor coverings having oak
flooring to the initial receptions and study and Travertine
limestone to the kitchen and utility, deep skirtings,
contemporary oak internals doors and modern kitchen and
bathrooms. 

The property boasts four main reception areas including a
spacious sitting room with conservatory off, a formal dual
aspect dining room with French doors out into the rear
garden, a useful home office ideal for today's way of
working and dual aspect kitchen, tastefully appointed with
a range of bespoke units, granite preparation surfaces and
integrated appliances, In addition there is a useful utility
room and ground floor cloak room. To the first floor there
are five double bedrooms, the light and airy master
bedroom having a generous range of fitted furniture and
benefitting from an ensuite bathroom. In addition there is
a further modernised, contemporary bathroom and
separate shower room. 

The property is neutrally decorated throughout and benefits
from UPVC double glazing and gas central heating and,
overall, is a fantastic space perfect for growing families.

As wel l a s t h e internal accommodation t h e property
occupies a delightful plot tucked away of the lane, offering
a considerable level of off road parking with garage and
electric car charging point and having gardens to all sides.
The gardens have well maintained borders with established
shrubs, the rear garden encompassing a timber summer
house as well as an attractive, open sided timber pergola
which provides a fantastic outdoor, covered, entertaining
space. The rear garden also benefits from a southerly

aspect across to adjacent paddocks.

Overall viewing is the only way to truly appreciate both the
location and accommodation on offer.

BOTTESFORD
The village of Bottesford is well equipped with local
amenities including primary and secondary schools, a
range of local shops, doctors and dentists, several public
houses and restaurants, railway station with links to
Nottingham and Grantham which gives a fast rail link to
London's Kings Cross in just over an hour. The A52, A46
and A1 are also close by providing excellent road access.

A COMPOSITE ENTRANCE DOOR WITH DOUBLE GLAZED
LIGHTS LEADS THROUGH INTO:

INITIAL ENCLOSED PORCH
6'9" x 4'2" (2.06m x 1.27m)
Having attractive arched, double glazed side panels, period
style tiled floor, deep skirting, power point and double
glazed entrance door and side light leading through into:

MAIN ENTRANCE HALL
15'2" x 7'8" (4.62m x 2.34m)

A pleasant, well proportioned vestibule having attractive
spindle balustrade staircase rising to a galleried landing
above with useful under stairs alcove beneath, wide board
wood flooring, deep skirting, central heating radiator and
coved ceiling.

Further oak internal doors lead to:

CLOAK ROOM
7'8" x 3'3" (2.34m x 0.99m)

Having built in vanity unit, WC with concealed cistern and
vanity surface over, wall mounted cupboard, pedestal
washbasin, contemporary towel radiator, deep skirting and
double glazed window to the rear.

SITTING ROOM
18'4" x 16' (5.59m x 4.88m)

A well proportioned, light and airy reception which links
through into the conservatory which, combined creates a
fantastic, everyday living/entertaining space, the focal point



to the room being a chimney breast with attractive
contemporary, inset, log effect fire and pre wired above in
preparation for flat screen, wall mounted televisions and
double glazed windows to the side. The room having
coved ceiling with central rose, deep skirting and two
central heating radiators.

A double glazed sliding patio door leads through into:

CONSERVATORY
11'7" x 11' (3.53m x 3.35m)

A useful addition to the property providing a further
versatile reception space, ideal as an additional sitting
room, having a pleasant aspect out into the rear garden.
The room having attractive timber effect tiled floor, deep
skirting, electric underfloor heating, double glazed
windows with opening top lights and French doors into
the garden.

FROM THE MAIN ENTRANCE HALL A LARGE OPEN
DOORWAY LEADS THROUGH INTO THE:

DINING ROOM
17'7" x 11'10" (5.36m x 3.61m)

A well proportioned, versatile reception which links the
entrance hall to the kitchen and is perfect as formal dining,
having an attractive dual aspect with double glazed
window to the front and French doors into the garden at
the rear. The room having continuation of the attractive
wood f loor ing,  deep sk i r t ing,  coved ce i l ing and
contemporary column radiators.

A pair of part glazed oak doors lead through into:



BREAKFAST KITCHEN
18'4" x 10'11" (5.59m x 3.33m)

A well proportioned space benefitting from a dual aspect
with double glazed windows to the side and rear affording
a pleasant aspect into the rear garden. The kitchen is
tastefully appointed with a generous range of bespoke
wall, base and drawer units with near full height larder
units, central alcove designed for free standing American
style fridge freezer with wine rack over, granite preparation
surfaces and upstands, undermounted Franke sink unit
with chrome swan neck Quooker boiling tap, free standing
gas and electric range with chimney hood over, under unit
lighting, integral dishwasher and recycling drawer,
attractive Travertine effect tiled floor, deep skirting, coved
ceiling and contemporary column radiator.

A further door leads through into:



UTILITY
17' max x 7'8" max (5.18m max x 2.34m max)

A well proportioned space having access into both the
front and rear gardens, the room fitted with wall and base
units having laminate preparation surface, inset stainless
steel sink and drain unit with chrome mixer tap and tiled
splash backs, under counter wine cooler, built in boiler
cupboard which also has plumbing for washing machine
and wall mounted Ideal gas central heating boiler,
continuation of the Travertine effect flooring and deep
skirting.

A further door leads into:

CLOAK ROOM
5' x 2'8" (1.52m x 0.81m)

Having a two piece suite comprising close coupled WC
and vanity unit with inset washbasin, central heating
radiator, continuation of the tiled floor and double glazed
window to the side.

STUDY
16'10" x 7'9" (5.13m x 2.36m)

A fantastic space ideal for today's way of home working,
creating a superb office fully fitted wi th a range o f
integrated furniture the study area having built in shelved
book cases, storage cupboards and low level drawer units,



inset downlighters to the ceiling, contemporary column
radiator, oak effect flooring, deep skirting and double
glazed window to the front.

A further courtesy door gives access into:

GARAGE
18' x 7'10 (5.49m x 2.39m)
Having power and light and bifold door to the front.

RETURNING TO THE MAIN ENTRANCE HALL A SPINDLE
BALUSTRADE STAIRCASE RISES TO:

FIRST FLOOR GALLERIED LANDING

Having built in airing cupboard with sliding doors, deep
skirting, coved ceiling, central heating radiator and
doubled glazed window overlooking the rear garden and
paddock beyond.

Further oak doors lead to:

BEDROOM 1
18'4" x 14'6" (5.59m x 4.42m)

A well proportioned double bedroom benefitting from a
dual aspect with double glazed window to the front and
rear, fitted with a generous range of integrated furniture

with full height wardrobes, low level drawer units, dressing
table and overhead storage cupboards, the room having
deep skirting, coved ceiling and central heating radiator.

A further door leading through into:



ENSUITE BATHROOM
9'9" x 6'11" (2.97m x 2.11m)

Having a white suite comprising panelled bath with
chrome mixer tap, wall mounted, digitally controlled
shower mixer over and glass screen, vanity unit providing a
useful level of storage, WC with concealed cistern and
vanity surface over with inset washbasin, fully tiled walls
with mosaic border inlay, contemporary towel radiator and
double glazed window to the front.

BEDROOM 2
17'5" x 11'3" (5.31m x 3.43m)

A well proportioned double bedroom benefitting from a

dual aspect having double glazed windows to two
elevations, a range of contemporary built in furniture with
full height wardrobes, complementing side tables and
drawer units, central heating radiators and inset
downlighters to the ceiling.

BEDROOM 3
18'3" max x 10'9" max into wardrobes (5.56m max x 3.28m
max into wardrobes)

A well proportioned L shaped double bedroom which
would be ideal for teenagers, having initial reception
dressing area with built in study desk/dressing table and
integral drawer units opening out into bedroom area with
fitted wardrobes with sliding door fronts, a dual aspect
with double glazed windows to two elevations and
delightful views across to adjacent paddocks, coved ceiling
and two central heating radiators.

BEDROOM 4
13'8" x 12'2" (4.17m x 3.71m)

A well proportioned, L shaped double bedroom having
fitted furniture with full height wardrobes, dressing table,
drawer units and overhead cupboard, central heating
radiator, wood effect laminate flooring and double glazed
windows to two elevations.



BEDROOM 5

A further double bedroom having fitted furniture with full
height wardrobes, overhead cupboard, dressing table and
side tables, central heating radiator and double glazed
window.

SHOWER ROOM
6'6" x 4'11" (1.98m x 1.50m)

Having a suite comprising quadrant shower enclosure with
wall mounted shower mixer, close coupled WC and
pedestal washbasin, fully tiled walls and contemporary
towel radiator.

MAIN BATHROOM
9'3" x 6'4" (2.82m x 1.93m)

Having a contemporary suite comprising attractive double
ended, free standing elliptical bath with free standing
shower mixer tap, separate shower wet area with glass
screen and wall mounted shower mixer with both
independent  handset  and ra inwater  rose  over ,
contemporary tiled walls, column radiator, vanity unit with
overmounted washbasin with chrome mixer tap, WC with
concealed cistern, electric underfloor heating and double
glazed window.



EXTERIOR

The property is tucked away in a fantastic location,
positioned off a private driveway, set back behind the lane,
providing a pleasant secluded setting. Wrought iron
electric gates give access onto a substantial block set
driveway with established borders well stocked with a
range of shrubs and providing an excellent level of off road
parking which, in turn, leads to the attached garage and
electric car charging point. To the side of the garage is a
substantial timber workshop/storage shed which provides
an excellent level of space having window and courtesy
door to the side and double doors to the front. The rear
garden is a delightful feature of the property, benefitting
from a southerly aspect onto adjacent paddocks with initial
paved terrace leading back into the main receptions and
providing a pleasant seating area looking out onto a mainly
lawned garden which is well stocked with established trees
and shrubs and also encompasses a useful summer house.
On the westerly side of the rear garden is an attractive
timber pergola which provides a superb outdoor seating
area ideal for all times of year being a covered space
perfect for relaxing and entertaining. In additional there is
numerous outdoor lighting and weather proof sockets.



COUNCIL TAX BAND
Melton Borough Council ‐ Band F
This information is taken from the individual local
authorities website.

TENURE
Freehold

ADDITIONAL INFORMATION
Please see the l inks below to check for additional
information regarding environmental criteria (i.e. flood
assessment), school Ofsted ratings, planning applications
and services such as broadband and phone signal. Note
Richard Watkinson & Partners has no affiliation to any of
the below agencies and cannot be responsible for any
incorrect information provided by the individual sources.

Flood assessment of an area:_
https://check‐long‐term‐flood‐risk.service.gov.uk/risk#

Broadband & Mobile coverage:‐
https://checker.ofcom.org.uk/en‐gb/broadband‐coverage

School Ofsted reports:‐
https://reports.ofsted.gov.uk/

Planning applications:‐
https://www.gov.uk/search‐register‐planning‐decisions





These particulars, whilst believed to be accurate are set out as a general outline only for guidance and do not constitute any part of an offer or contract. Intending purchasers should not rely on them as statements of representation of fact, but must satisfy themselves by inspection
or otherwise as to their accuracy. No person in this firms employment has the authority to make or give any representation or warranty in respect of the property. Any fixtures and fittings not mentioned in these details are excluded from the sale price. No services or appliances which
may have been included in these details have been tested by the selling agent and therefore cannot be guaranteed to be in good working order.

As part of the service we offer we may recommend ancillary services to you such as mortgage advice, solicitors and surveyors which we believe will help with your property transaction. We wish to make you aware that should you decide to proceed we may receive a referral fee or
equivalent. This could be a fee, commission, payment or other reward. We will not refer your details unless you have provided consent for us to do so. You are not under any obligation to provide us with your consent or to use any of these services. You are also free to choose an
alternative provider.

10 Market Street,
Bingham NG13 8AB
Tel: 01949 836678
Email: bingham@richardwatkinson.co.uk

Richard Watkinson & Partners is the trading name of Richard Watkinson Ltd.
Registered in England. Ltd Registration number: 07140024

Thinking of selling? For a FREE no obligation quotation call 01949 836678


