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Key Features 
 

• 3 Bedrooms Detached 

House 

• Family Bathroom, 

Downstairs WC 

• Double Garage, Off-road 

Parking, Driveway 

• Spacious Rear Garden 

• Separate Living Room and 

Dining Room 

• Gas central Heating & 

Double glazing 

• EPC rating D 

• Freehold 

Offers over £310,000 



 

 

This detached house, perfectly positioned 
in one of St Peters' most desirable 
locations. With a double garage, a 
driveway, three bedrooms, and private 
garden, this property offers an exciting 
opportunity for buyers to create a truly 
bespoke family home. 
 
The home opens with a welcoming 
entrance porch and hallway, complete 
with convenient understairs storage and a 
downstairs cloakroom/WC. The dual-
aspect living room with a fire place is 
bright and comfortable, while the dining 
room enjoys lovely garden views and 
connects to the kitchen - a layout that 
lends itself beautifully to modern open-
plan living if desired. 
 
Upstairs, the home provides two double 
bedrooms, a well-sized single bedroom, 
and a family bathroom. The property is 
perfectly functional yet offers great scope 
for modernisation and personalisation, 
making it a superb long-term investment. 
 
Externally, a highly versatile double 
garage, and a private rear garden which is 
ideal for family gatherings. 
 

Location 
 Located within St Peters (WR5), the 
property enjoys a wealth of nearby 
amenities, including local shops, 
supermarkets, and leisure facilities. 
Excellent transport links are close at hand, 
with Junction 7 of the M5 providing swift 
access to other cities. 
 
This is a well-priced property in a brilliant 
location, offering the perfect opportunity 
to make it your family's forever home. 
 
Don't miss the opportunity to view this 
property! 
 
  
 
 
  
 
 
  
 
 
  
 

 
  
 

 
  
 
 
  
 
 



 

 

 

01905 330 530 
worcester@northwooduk.com 

 


