
Price: £175,000 Subject to Contract

Viewing: Strictly by arrangement with The Agents  (01704) 500 008  

Wet Room

South facing Rear Garden
Inspection Recommended

Semi Detached Bungalow

Two Bedrooms
Wheelchair Accessible

Scarisbrick New Road
Southport, PR8 6LR



An early inspection is recommended of this two 
bedroom semi-detached bungalow, adapted by the 
current owners to provide well planned, wheel chair 
accessible accommodation.

Installed with gas central heating and upvc double 
glazing, the well presented property briefly comprises: 
Hall, Lounge open to Kitchen, two Bedrooms and Wet 
Room.

Outside, the front garden is accessed via twin wrought 
iron gates and is gravel laid to provide off road parking 
for a number of vehicles. The rear garden offers a 

southerly aspect and is arranged with paved patio, 
shaped lawn and established borders.

The bungalow stands on Scarisbrick New Road 
between the junctions of Everard Road and Ashdown 
Close, well placed for accessing the amenities of Kew 
with Southport town centre a short drive away.



GROUND FLOOR:

Hall

Lounge/Kitchen - 5.54m overall x 4.14m overall (18'2" x 
13'7")

Bedroom 1 - 4.06m x 2.87m (13'4" x 9'5")

Bedroom 2 - 3.23m into bay x 2.87m (10'7" x 9'5")

Wet Room - 5.46m x 1.57m overall (17'11" x 5'2")

Outside: The front garden is accessed via twin wrought 
iron gates and is gravel laid to provide off road parking 
for a number of vehicles. The rear garden offers a 
southerly aspect and is arranged with paved patio, 
shaped lawn and established borders.

Council Tax: Enquiries made of the Council Tax 
Valuation List indicate the property has been placed in 
Band (D)

Tenure: Freehold

Mobile Phone Signal: Check signal strengths by clicking 
this link: https://www.signalchecker.co.uk/

Broadband: Check the availability by clicking this link: 
https://labs.thinkbroadband.com/local/index.php

NB: We are required under the Money Laundering 
Regulations to check Purchaser's Identification 
Documents at the time of agreement to purchase.
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