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  304, Scot Lane, Wigan, WN5 9TA 

• Spacious 3 bed semi-detached house  

• Brand new kitchen & bathroom 

• South facing garden & ample parking 

• New double glazing throughout 

• Newly renovated & Corner plot  

• Large fitted utility room 

• All new electrics & GCH heating 

• 989 SQ.FT. / Freehold / No chain 

304 Scot Lane offers spacious and fully renovated three-bedroom family 
accommodation, ideally positioned in a highly sought-after location within walking 
distance of a wide range of excellent amenities.  The property has been 
comprehensively updated throughout, including brand new electrics, plumbing, 
and heating systems. The interior has been freshly decorated, new flooring 
installed, and both the kitchen and bathroom have been fully replaced with stylish, 
modern fittings. The home is truly turn-key ready.  Built to a solid traditional 
design, the accommodation is bright and generously proportioned, featuring a 
welcoming entrance hallway with a refurbished staircase, two formal reception 
rooms, and a sleek fitted kitchen with a large utility area. From here, there is 
access to a fully enclosed, larger-than-average rear garden which enjoys a sunny, 
south-facing aspect.  Upstairs, a central landing leads to three well-proportioned 
bedrooms and a spacious, newly fitted family bathroom.  Occupying a prominent 
corner plot, the property benefits from generous gardens to the front, side, and 
rear, along with a driveway offering ample off-road parking for multiple vehicles. 
There is also excellent potential for future extension, subject to the necessary 
planning consents.  Enjoying open views to the front and located close to Robin 
Park Retail Centre, the property also provides easy access to Wigan town centre, 
making it a highly desirable home for families and professionals alike.  Offered for 
sale with no onward chain, early viewing is strongly recommended to avoid 
missing out on this standout property. 

  

 

Spacious and fully renovated three-bedroom house on large south facing corner plot. 



 

 

 

 

 

 
  

 

 



 
 

 

 


