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  52, Avon Road, Billinge , WN5 7QU 

• Superb detached family home   

• Significantly extended 

• Newly installed boiler 

• Beautiful overall plot 

• 3 bedrooms / 3 reception rooms  

• Impeccably presented throughout 

• Highly prized setting 

• 1251 SQFT 

Immaculately presented throughout & benefiting from various upgrades and 
enhancements - this beautiful, detached family home is located on one of Billinge's 
most coveted settings & early inspection is essential. Avon Road itself is a lovely, 
quiet little setting that rests conveniently close to the area’s shops, amenities plus 
highly acclaimed schools.  Set back from the road & enjoying considerable 
frontage, the property has been significantly extended and remodelled from its 
original design, benefiting from a large two extension to the side, plus a rear 
extension too. The home internally is presented in a light, contemporary colour 
scheme & would be perfect for any young families seeking a turn-key property 
they can simply move straight into.  The property boasts newly laid carpets & 
luxury vinyl tiles in parts, fresh decoration & in brief comprises; an entrance 
hallway, pretty front lounge with feature fireplace, a spacious rear diner which is 
much larger than average courtesy of a rear extension & flows into a smart fitted 
kitchen which boasts a range of quality NEFF integrated appliances. Upstairs, the 
home provides three immaculate & spacious bedrooms with fitted units to the 
particularly impressive master bed, plus there is a smart, fully tiled principal 
bathroom.  Externally, the home rests on a pleasant overall plot, with a private rear 
garden that benefits from a large flagged patio area for sitting out. To the front is 
an extended driveway providing ample off road parking & leading through to an 
integral garage. All the windows are Upvc & the property boasts a newly installed 
boiler just 18 months ago. Early viewings are highly recommended to appreciate 
the size of home on offer. 

  

 

A superb example of an extended detached home offering 1251 SQFT of living space. 



 

 

 

 

 

 
  

 

 



 
 

 

 


