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welcome to  

Rosemary Cottage Waxham Road, Sea Palling Norwich 

CHARMING AND FULL OF CHARACTER! This attractive Cottage is in the very popular location of Sea Palling. Currently a successful Holiday Let but 

would make a marvellous Home! Well-presented accommodation with Seaside theme Courtyard and further Garden with Potential for further 

Holiday Use. 

   

   



 

 

 

 
view this property online  williamhbrown.co.uk/Property/NWS107946 

 

Entrance Hall 
having side entrance door with part glazing and side 
window. Stairs to first floor with understairs 
cupboard. Radiator. 
 

 

Cloakroom 

with WC, wash hand basin and radiator. 
 

 

Utility Room 

4' 10" x 13' 4" max ( 1.47m x 4.06m max ) 

with window to front, butler sink and worktops to 
either side, plumbing and space for automatic 
washing machine. Tongue and grooved splashback. 
Inset lighting to the ceiling and radiator. 
 

 

Sitting Room 

12'  x 18' 3" max ( 3.66m x 5.56m max ) 

having attractive brick fireplace with wood burner set 
on hearth and timber mantle over. Two windows to 
front, two radiator and beams to ceiling. Dado rail 
and three wall light points. Opening to: 
 

 

Dining Area 

4' 10" x 13' 4" max ( 1.47m x 4.06m max ) 

having two windows to the rear and radiator. Dado 
rail and two wall lights. 
 

 

Lobby To Kitchen 

having matching units to the kitchen with useful 
storage and giving access to: 
 

 

Kitchen 

having a good range of units at base and wall level, 
worktops over and inset ceramic sink. Built in oven, 
hob and extractor. Built in dishwasher. Breakfast bar. 
Windows to both sides. Tiled splashback, inset lights 
to ceiling. Radiator, half glazed door giving access to 
courtyard garden. 
 

First Floor 

stairs leading from Entrance hall to first floor landing 
with high level window to side, beams to ceiling. 
 

 

Master Bedroom 1 

7' 7" x 12' 9" ( 2.31m x 3.89m ) 

having sky light window and window to rear aspect. 
Radiator, sloping ceiling, built in range of wardrobe 
cupboard. 
 

 

Bedroom 2 

10'  max x 9'  ( 3.05m max x 2.74m ) 

with window to front, radiator and loft hatch. 
 

 

Bedroom 3 

8' 1" x 12'  ( 2.46m x 3.66m ) 

having window to front, radiator and sloping ceilings. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

Bedroom 4 

4' 10" x 9' 7" max ( 1.47m x 2.92m max ) 

with window to rear, radiator, sloping ceiling with 
inset lights. 
 

 

Bathroom 

having bath with central tap, vanity unit, WC and 
shower enclosure. Window to front, tiled splashback 
and radiator. Inset lights to ceiling, extractor fan and 
towel radiator. 
 

 

Outside 

The cottage is approached over a share driveway 
leading to enclosed courtyard garden and giving 
access to further garden area. 
Small fore garden set back behind picket fencing. 
The rear enclosed courtyard garden is accessed via a 
timber hand gate. Attractive set out in a seaside 
theme style with cobbles and timber effect 
steppingstones and offers seating areas with 
planting to raised bed. Oil tank discretely screened. 
Access to the rear entrance door. 
There is a further garden located further down the 
shared driveway which offers off road parking for 
vehicles.  There is laid to lawn and has a Summer 
House and Storage Shed. The neighbouring 
properties have used this garden area to provide 
further holiday let accommodation and Rosemary 
Cottage's Garden may have potential to do likewise. 
This garden area overlooks the sand dunes to the 
rear. 
 



 

 

 

 

 

 

1. MONEY LAUNDERING REGULATIONS Intending purchasers will be asked to produce identification documentation at a later stage and we 

would ask for your co-operation in order that there is no delay in agreeing the sale. 2. These particulars do not constitute part or all of an offer 

or contract. 3. The measurements indicated are supplied for guidance only and as such must be considered incorrect. Potential buyers are 

advised to recheck measurements before committing to any expense. 4. We have not tested any apparatus, equipment, fixtures or services and 

it is in the buyers interest to check the working condition of any appliances. 5. Where an EPC, or a Home Report (Scotland only) is held for this 

property, it is available for inspection at the branch by appointment. If you require a printed version of a Home Report, you will need to pay a 

reasonable production charge reflecting printing and other costs. 6. We are not able to offer an opinion either written or verbal on the content 

of these reports and this must be obtained from your legal representative. 7. Whilst we take care in preparing these reports, a buyer should 

ensure that his/her legal representative confirms as soon as possible all matters relating to title including the extent and boundaries of the 

property and other important matters before exchange of contracts. 

William H Brown  is a trading name of Sequence (UK) Limited which is registered in England and Wales under company number 4268443, Registered Office is Cumbria 

House, 16-20 Hockliffe Street, Leighton Buzzard, Bedfordshire, LU7 1GN.  VAT Registration Number is 500 2481 05.   

 

 01692 581034 

 
stalham@williamhbrown.co.uk 

 

52 High Street, Stalham, NORWICH, Norfolk, 

NR12 9AS 

 williamhbrown.co.uk  

welcome to 

Rosemary Cottage Waxham Road, Sea 

Palling Norwich 

• Successful Seaside Holiday Let/Coastal Located Home 

in SEA PALLING 

• Charming and Full of Character Cottage within 

Walking Distance of Beach 

• 4 Bedrooms 

• Two Garden with Off Road Parking and Potential for 

Further Development STC 

• Viewing Essential to Appreciate 
 

Tenure: Freehold EPC Rating: E 
 

 

 

guide price  

£425,000 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Please note the marker reflects the 

postcode not the actual property 

   

Property Ref: 

NWS107946 - 0007 

 

view this property online  williamhbrown.co.uk/Property/NWS107946 

 

 


