
 

 

 

 

  

Beckmeadow Way, Mundesley, Norwich, NR11 8LR 

 

 

 

 



 
 

 

 

 

welcome to  

Beckmeadow Way, Mundesley, Norwich 

This immaculately presented, individual three Bedroom chalet style Bungalow, with double Garage & ample driveway parking is situated in a highly 

sought cul-de-sac location in the popular coastal village of Mundesley! 

   

   



 

 

 

 
view this property online  williamhbrown.co.uk/Property/NWM108943 

 

Description 
Situated in a cul-de-sac at the end of Beckmeadow 
Way, and with easy access to Paston Road, 
Mundesley Beach and village centre, this spacious 
detached Chalet Bungalow would make an ideal 
family home, second home or holiday let. 
 
The property offers accommodation comprising 
Entrance Hall, Lounge/Diner, Sun Room, Kitchen, two 
double Bedrooms and Bathroom on the ground 
floor.  
On the first floor, you will find a Main Bedroom with 
En-suite and Dressing Area, along with a separate 
Cloakroom. Externally, the property boasts a double 
Garage (measuring 20'6" x 17'7"), with electric roller 
door, power, light and water supply. There is ample 
driveway parking and a good sized wraparound 
garden mainly laid to lawn with mature plants, 
shrubs and Workshop, with power, lighting, double 
glazed windows, plastic door and has been recently 
re-clad with composite plastic cladding. 
The property was extensively renovated 
approximately 20 years ago, including updated 
electrics, roofing, plumbing, extension work, 
plastering and under floor heating on the ground 
floor. The solar panels on the south aspect, generate 
approximately £2,500 per annum for the current 
owner and the property would be sold with 12 years 
left of the tariff agreement included. 
 
Entrance Hall 
Front door opens into hallway with stairs to first 
floor, under stair cupboard, airing cupboard & 
laminate flooring.  
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Lounge / Diner 

22' 1" x 16' 5" into Bay (6.73m x 5.00m into Bay) 

Double glazed bay window to rear aspect, fireplace, 
picture rails, television and telephone points and 
laminated flooring. 
 

Kitchen 

15' 7" x 14' 4" (4.75m x 4.37m) 

Fitted kitchen with range of wall and base units with 
work surfaces over, electric oven with gas hob and 
cooker hood above, one and a half sized stainless 
steel sink drainer, space for fridge freezer, 
dishwasher, pantry cupboard & coat drying 
cupboard, which houses Viessman gas central 
heating boiler. Breakfast bar, television and 
telephone points, tiled splash backs, double glazed 
window to front aspect, door to side aspect and tiled 
flooring. 
 

Sun Room 

12' 8" x 11' 6" (3.86m x 3.51m) 

Brick base with uPVC windows and doors, insulated 
tiled roof, plumbing for washing machine and tiled 
flooring. 
 

Bedroom Two 

12' 1" x 10' 10" (3.68m x 3.30m) 

Double glazed window to rear aspect, picture rails 
and carpeted flooring. 
 

Bedroom Three 

10' 11" x 10' 10" (3.33m x 3.30m) 

Built-in cupboard & bookcase, double glazed 
window to front aspect, picture rails and laminated 
flooring. 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Bathroom 

Suite comprising corner bath with shower over, WC, 
wash hand basin, shaver point, double glazed 
window to side aspect, part tiled walls and laminated 
flooring. 
 

First Floor Landing 

Storage cupboard housing hot water tank, eaves 
storage and carpeted flooring. 
 

Master Bedroom Suite 

16' 8" x 15' 8" (5.08m x 4.78m) 

Dual aspect skylights to front and rear, television and 
telephone points, fitted wardrobes, radiator, 
carpeted flooring. Shower cubicle, wash hand basin 
and extractor fan.  
 

Exterior 

At the front of the property is a front lawn, shrubs, 
low wall and large brick weave driveway for parking 
leading to an integrated double garage measuring 
20'6 x 17'7 with electric roller door, power, lighting, 
plumbing for washing machine, loft storage, double 
glazed window and door to rear aspect.  
At the rear of the property is a mature, enclosed 
garden mainly laid to lawn, patio, bushes, shrubs and 
a detached, insulated timber workshop with power 
and lighting. The solar panels fitted to the South 
aspect are on a 25 year tariff agreement which 
begun in 2011 and generate the current vendor 
approximately £2500 per annum. 
 



 

 

 

 

 

 

1. MONEY LAUNDERING REGULATIONS Intending purchasers will be asked to produce identification documentation at a later stage and we 

would ask for your co-operation in order that there is no delay in agreeing the sale. 2. These particulars do not constitute part or all of an offer 

or contract. 3. The measurements indicated are supplied for guidance only and as such must be considered incorrect. Potential buyers are 

advised to recheck measurements before committing to any expense. 4. We have not tested any apparatus, equipment, fixtures or services and 

it is in the buyers interest to check the working condition of any appliances. 5. Where an EPC, or a Home Report (Scotland only) is held for this 

property, it is available for inspection at the branch by appointment. If you require a printed version of a Home Report, you will need to pay a 

reasonable production charge reflecting printing and other costs. 6. We are not able to offer an opinion either written or verbal on the content 

of these reports and this must be obtained from your legal representative. 7. Whilst we take care in preparing these reports, a buyer should 

ensure that his/her legal representative confirms as soon as possible all matters relating to title including the extent and boundaries of the 

property and other important matters before exchange of contracts. 

William H Brown is a trading name of Sequence (UK) Limited which is registered in England and Wales under company number 4268443, Registered Office is Cumbria 

House, 16-20 Hockliffe Street, Leighton Buzzard, Bedfordshire, LU7 1GN.  VAT Registration Number is 500 2481 05.   

 

 01692 402861 

 
NorthWalsham@williamhbrown.co.uk 

 

16 Market Street, NORTH WALSHAM, Norfolk, 

NR28 9BZ 

 williamhbrown.co.uk  

welcome to 

Beckmeadow Way, Mundesley, Norwich 

• Individual Detached Property 

• Three Double Bedrooms 

• Wraparound Garden 

• Double Garage and Driveway Parking 

• Tucked Away Location 
 

Tenure: Freehold EPC Rating: B 
 

 

 

  

£525,000 
 

 

 

 

 

 

Please note the marker reflects the 

postcode not the actual property 

   

Property Ref: 

NWM108943 - 0004 

 

view this property online  williamhbrown.co.uk/Property/NWM108943 

 

 


