
 

 

 

 

  

Butternab Road, Beaumont Park, Huddersfield HD4 7AR 

 

 

 

 



 
 

 

 

 

welcome to  

Butternab Road, Beaumont Park Huddersfield 

A rare opportunity to purchase a high-spec home within walking distance of Beaumont Park, gated and secure with ample off-road parking, a 

garage, three reception rooms and an extended kitchen overlooking a private, enclosed rear garden. If space is what you are looking for, this is your 

new home! 

   

   



 

 

 

 
view this property online  williamhbrown.co.uk/Property/HDF116503 

 

Ground Floor 

Entrance Hall 
Front door leading to hallway with tiled flooring, 
central heating radiator and door to understairs 
storage. Stairs lead to the first floor. 
 

Living Room 

11' 10" x 11' 5" Plus Bay ( 3.61m x 3.48m Plus Bay ) 

Spacious reception room with carpeted flooring and 
warmed by a central heating radiator. Double glazed 
bay window overlooks the front. 
 

Dining Room 

12'  x 16' 11" ( 3.66m x 5.16m ) 

Superb sized dining room with integrated window 
seating areas, carpeted flooring and four frosted 
windows to the side. Double glazed bi-fold doors 
open to the rear garden. The room is warmed by a 
central heating radiator and has ceiling downlights. 
 

Kitchen 

17' 5" x 22' 2" ( 5.31m x 6.76m ) 

WOW! What a fantastic kitchen diner. This is the 
place to be. Fitted with a full range of base and wall 
units plus central Island unit. With integrated electric 
oven, steamer and dishwasher. Gas hob with 
extractor over and sink unit with spray tap. With part 
tiled walls and tiled flooring, ceiling spotlights and 
downlights plus two central heating radiators and 
space for dining table and chairs. The room has two  
skylights and two double glazed French doors which 
open to the rear garden. 
 

Utility Room 

8' 9" x 4' 9" ( 2.67m x 1.45m ) 

Perfect laundry room with fitted base units. Space for 
under counter washing machine and space for dryer. 
There is also space for an American style fridge 
freezer. With sink unit, central heating radiator and 
vinyl flooring. Double glazed window overlooks the 
side. 
 

Wc 

With marble effect tiled flooring, wash hand basin 
with mixer tap and low flush WC and a central 
heating radiator. 

First Floor Landing 

With carpeted flooring and loft access. 
 

Bedroom One 

12' 7" plus doorway x 11' 11" ( 3.84m plus doorway x 

3.63m ) 

Superbly spacious double bedroom with mirror 
fronted fitted wardrobes, carpeted flooring and two 
double glazed windows to the rear. Door to ensuite. 
 

Ensuite 

Ensuite shower room with double walk-in shower 
cubicle and waterfall tap, low flush WC and wash 
hand basin. Tiled walls, ceiling downlights, extractor 
and window to the side. 
 

Bedroom Two 

11' 4" x 12'  max into recess ( 3.45m x 3.66m max into 

recess ) 

Spacious double bedroom with carpeted flooring 
and warmed by a central heating radiator. Double 
glazed window overlooks the rear. 
 

Bedroom Three 

12' 5" x 11' 9" ( 3.78m x 3.58m ) 

Third spacious double bedroom with integrated 
wardrobes and overhead cupboards. With carpeted 
flooring and warmed by a central heating radiator. 
Double glazed window overlooks the front. 
 

Bedroom Four 

11' 6" x 10' 9" to chimney breast ( 3.51m x 3.28m to 

chimney breast ) 

Spacious double bedroom with integrated 
wardrobes, carpeted flooring and warmed by a 
central heating radiator. Double glazed window 
overlooks the front with views. 
 

Bedroom Five 

9' 9" max x 7' 11" max ( 2.97m max x 2.41m max ) 

Good sized room with carpeted flooring and warmed 
by a central heating radiator. Double glazed window 
overlooks the front with views to Castle Hill. 

Bathroom 

Modern bathroom suite comprising bath with 
shower over, low flush WC and vanity sink unit. 
Heated towel warmer/radiator, ceiling spotlights, 
tiled floor and a double glazed window to the rear. 
 

External 
To the front of the property is a tarmac driveway 
enclosed by fencing with raised lawned garden and 
access to an integral garage. 
 
To the rear is a good sized South facing garden with 
decked seating areas, space for hot tub and BBQ 
area being privately enclosed by fencing. 
 



 

 

 

 

 

 

1. MONEY LAUNDERING REGULATIONS Intending purchasers will be asked to produce identification documentation at a later stage and we 

would ask for your co-operation in order that there is no delay in agreeing the sale. 2. These particulars do not constitute part or all of an offer 

or contract. 3. The measurements indicated are supplied for guidance only and as such must be considered incorrect. Potential buyers are 

advised to recheck measurements before committing to any expense. 4. We have not tested any apparatus, equipment, fixtures or services and 

it is in the buyers interest to check the working condition of any appliances. 5. Where an EPC, or a Home Report (Scotland only) is held for this 

property, it is available for inspection at the branch by appointment. If you require a printed version of a Home Report, you will need to pay a 

reasonable production charge reflecting printing and other costs. 6. We are not able to offer an opinion either written or verbal on the content 

of these reports and this must be obtained from your legal representative. 7. Whilst we take care in preparing these reports, a buyer should 

ensure that his/her legal representative confirms as soon as possible all matters relating to title including the extent and boundaries of the 

property and other important matters before exchange of contracts. 

William H Brown  is a trading name of Sequence (UK) Limited which is registered in England and Wales under company number 4268443, Registered Office is Cumbria 

House, 16-20 Hockliffe Street, Leighton Buzzard, Bedfordshire, LU7 1GN.  VAT Registration Number is 500 2481 05.   

 

 01484 542072 

 
huddersfield@williamhbrown.co.uk 

 

8 Westgate, HUDDERSFIELD, West Yorkshire, 

HD1 1NN 

 williamhbrown.co.uk  

welcome to 

Butternab Road, Beaumont Park Huddersfield 

• Ideal For The Growing Family - Close To Schools & Beaumont Park 

• Stunning & Spacious Throughout - Newly Renovated & High Specification 

• Gated & Secure Entry System 

• Three Reception Rooms Including A Separate Utility Room 

• Private, Enclosed Rear Garden & Garage Space 

• Far Reaching Views Of Castle Hill 
 

Tenure: Freehold EPC Rating: C 
 

 

 

offers in the region of  

£450,000 
 

 

 

 

 

 

Please note the marker reflects the 

postcode not the actual property 

   

Property Ref: 

HDF116503 - 0003 

 

view this property online  williamhbrown.co.uk/Property/HDF116503 

 


