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A Most Spacious Three Storey House Enjoying An Enviable Location Only A 

Short Distance From Both Exmouth Town Centre And Sea Front Offering 

Deceptively Spacious And Well Presented Living Accommodation  

 

Reception Hall • Lounge • Stylish Kitchen/Dining Room • Ground Floor Cloakroom/WC •  

Two First Floor Bedrooms • First Floor Bathroom Suite •  

Second Floor Main Bedroom Suite With En-Suite Shower Room/WC • 

Gas Central Heating & Double Glazed Windows • Attractive Enclosed Rear Garden And Garage • 

Wonderful Permanent Home Or Holiday Retreat • 

21 Cyprus Gardens, Exmouth, Devon, EX8 2DP 

 
 

PRICE £530,000 

TENURE  Freehold 

 
 

 

 

 

  

 



 
21 Cyprus Gardens, Exmouth, Devon, EX8 2DP 

 
 
THE ACCOMMODATION COMPRISES:  Feature arched entrance porch with tiled flooring; front door 
with spy-hole and patterned glazed window inset giving access to:  
 
ENTRANCE HALL:  With staircase rising to the first floor landing; radiator; wood flooring; smoke 
detector; thermostat control for central heating; security alarm control panel.  
 
LOUNGE:  13' 9" x 11' 7" (4.19m x 3.53m) uPVC double glazed sash style window to front aspect; 
television point; radiator; wall mounted pebble effect living flame electric fire; wood flooring; access to 
understairs storage cupboard; door leading to:  
 
INNER HALLWAY:  With doors leading to the kitchen/dining room and the cloakroom/WC.  
 
CLOAKROOM/WC:  Comprising of a pedestal wash hand basin with tiled splashback and chrome mixer 
tap; WC with dual push button flush; radiator; ceiling extractor fan.  
 
KITCHEN/DINING ROOM:  15' 2" x 12' 7" (4.62m x 3.84m) narrowing to 8' 7" (2.62m). A spacious room 
fitted with a range of patterned gloss finished granite work top surfaces with tiled surrounds; range of 
base cupboards, drawer units, integrated dishwasher beneath work tops; matching range of wall 
mounted cupboards with concealed lighting beneath and one housing the gas boiler serving domestic 
hot water and central heating; inset Franke sink unit with integrated drainer; inset induction hob with 
stainless steel chimney style extractor hood over; wall mounted microwave oven with storage cupboard 
over; built-in oven with drawer units beneath and storage cupboard over; integrated fridge and freezer; 
two floor-to ceiling matching units; two radiators; recess ceiling spotlighting and ceiling extractor fan; 
uPVC double glazed window to rear aspect; uPVC double glazed double doors opening onto the rear 
garden.  
 
FIRST FLOOR LANDING:  uPVC double glazed sash style window to front aspect; smoke detector; 
radiator; cupboard with shelving; staircase rising to the SECOND FLOOR.  
 
BEDROOM TWO:  13' 9" x 8' 5" (4.19m x 2.57m) uPVC double glazed sash style window to front 
aspect; radiator; telephone point.  
 
BEDROOM THREE:  12' 11" x 8' 5" (3.94m x 2.57m) uPVC double glazed window to rear aspect; 
radiator.  
 
FIRST FLOOR BATHROOM/WC:  Stylishly fitted and comprising of a bath with Mira shower unit over 
and shower splash screen; contemporary style wash hand basin with chrome mixer tap and drawer units 
beneath; WC with push button flush; attractive tiling to splash prone areas; chrome heated towel rail; 
ceiling extractor fan; shaver socket; uPVC double glazed window with patterned glass and deep tiled 
window sill.  
 
SECOND FLOOR LANDING AREA:  With smoke detector and door leading to:  
 
MAIN BEDROOM SUITE:  24' 4" x 11' 7" (7.42m x 3.53m) narrowing at one end to 5' 10" (1.78m). A 
most bright and spacious room with uPVC double glazed sash style window to front aspect;  feature part 
sloping ceiling with double glazed Velux window to rear aspect; built-in mirror-fronted wardrobe with 
clothes rail and shelf; access to eaves storage space; two radiators.  
 
EN-SUITE SHOWER ROOM/WC:  Comprising of a good size shower cubicle with shower unit and 
splashback walls; contemporary style wash hand basin with chrome mixer tap and drawer unit beneath; 
WC with pushbutton flush; attractive tiling to splash prone areas; shaver socket; radiator; part sloping 
ceiling with double glazed Velux window to rear aspect.  
 
 
 

OUTSIDE:  Directly to the front of the property there is a decorative stone garden area with block paved 
pathway leading to the property. To the rear there is a charming garden which is fully enclosed and 
offers a high degree of privacy and seclusion and offering an array of colour from various shrubs. 
Comprising of a patio sun terrace area ideal for alfresco dining/entertaining; artificial lawn areas; patio 
pathway stretching the length of the garden and leading to a rear pedestrian gate giving access to the 
GARAGE. Outside cold water tap.  
 
GARAGE:  With block paved parking area directly to the front; up and over door; power and light 
connected. Ideally located directly behind the property.  
 
 

 
FLOOR PLAN: 

 
 

 

 

 


