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welcome to  

New Mill Road, Brockholes Holmfirth 

***NO UPPER CHAIN***DELIGHTFUL SEMI DETACHED COTTAGE PRESENTED TO A HIGH STANDARD AND AFFORDING TWO DOUBLE BEDROOM 

ACCOMMODATION WITH A WEALTH OF CHARACTER AND ENJOYING PLEASANT WOODED OUTLOOK ON THE FRINGES OF THE VILLAGE OF 

BROCKHOLES 

 

 

 

Summary 

A rare opportunity has arisen to purchase a 
delightful character residence Willowdene. The 
property boasts generous two bedroom 
accommodation that the current vendors have 
presented to the highest standards. The cottage 
briefly comprises: stylish kitchen leading to open 
plan lounge/diner, aforementioned first floor 
bedrooms and house bathroom. Further enhanced 
externally by off street parking there are also 
elevated cottage gardens ideal for relaxing with 
family or friends. With its wooded outlook the 
property sits perfectly for local villages and their 
amenities and is also perfectly placed for major 
commuting routes. Inspection highly recommended. 
 

Accommodation 

Breakfast Kitchen 

14' 4" x 7' 6" ( 4.37m x 2.29m ) 

Fitted with a stylish range of wall and base units 
with complementary butchers block effect 
worksurfaces incorporating a one and a half bowl 
sink and drainer unit with mixer tap. There is a 
cooker point and plumbing for a washing machine 
whilst the room has tiled surrounds, a laminate floor 
covering, electric velux roof window controlled by a 
remote, providing additional natural light and 
double glazed window to front aspect. 
 

Lounge/ Dining Room 

20' 6" x 14'  max ( 6.25m x 4.27m max ) 

A generously proportioned room with ample space 
for freestanding living and dining furniture. The 
focal point of the room is the multi fuel stove set to 
feature brick fireplace with timber mantel. Further 
character is provided by the beams to ceiling whilst 
there is a quality laminate floor covering, various 
wall light points, two central heating radiators and 
the room is double glazed to front and side aspects. 

 

First Floor 

On the landing is entrance to the loft with a pull 
down ladder, boarded out to provide extra storage 
the loft also has lighting and power. 
 

Bedroom One 

13' 2" x 7' 6" ( 4.01m x 2.29m ) 

A double room with natural light flooding through 
the room via the double glazed windows to two 
aspects. There is also a central heating radiator. 
 

Bedroom Two 

9' 2" x 6' 6" ( 2.79m x 1.98m ) 

The second bedroom could act as a guest room or 
home office and has a central heating radiator and 
is double glazed to front aspect with a wooded 
outlook. 
 

House Bathroom 

Attractively presented room with a white suite 
comprising of low flush w/c, pedestal hand 
washbasin and roll top bath with telephone style 
attachment. There are complementary tiled 
surrounds, a timber floor covering, extractor, period 
style radiator/towel rail and a double glazed obscure 
window. 
 

External 
To the front of the property is a gated off street 
parking space and useful storage outbuilding. There 
is log storage and further storage under the the 
stairs. The elevated gardens to the side of the 
property are well established with a vast array of 
plants and shrubs and there are seating areas ideal 
for simply relaxing in and watching the world go by, 
with extra storage shed. 
 



 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
view this property online  williamhbrown.co.uk/Property/HMF108016 

 

 



 

 

 

directions to this property:  

 
Leave Holmfirth via the Huddersfield Road. At the crossroads at 

Thongsbridge, turn right down Miry Lane. Turn left onto Luke 

Lane and at the bottom of the hill and proceed up to the t 

junction where the property can be identified by the for sale 

board. 

 

 

 

welcome to 

New Mill Road, Brockholes Holmfirth 

• ***NO UPPER CHAIN*** 

• Semi Detached Cottage 

• Two Double Bedrooms 

• Delightful Gardens 

• Off Street Parking 
 

Tenure: Freehold EPC Rating: D 
 
 

 

offers in the region of  

£235,000 
 

 

 

 

view this property online  williamhbrown.co.uk/Property/HMF108016 

 

 01484 687818 

 
holmfirth@williamhbrown.co.uk 

 

34 Victoria Street, HOLMFIRTH, W Yorks, HD9 

7DE 

 williamhbrown.co.uk  

Property Ref: 

HMF108016 - 0010 

 

1. MONEY LAUNDERING REGULATIONS Intending purchasers will be asked to produce identification documentation at a later stage and we 

would ask for your co-operation in order that there is no delay in agreeing the sale. 2. These particulars do not constitute part or all of an 

offer or contract. 3. The measurements indicated are supplied for guidance only and as such must be considered incorrect. Potential buyers 

are advised to recheck measurements before committing to any expense. 4. We have not tested any apparatus, equipment, fixtures or 

services and it is in the buyers interest to check the working condition of any appliances. 5. Where an EPC, or a Home Report (Scotland only) 

is held for this property, it is available for inspection at the branch by appointment. If you require a printed version of a Home Report, you 

will need to pay a reasonable production charge reflecting printing and other costs. 6. We are not able to offer an opinion either written or 

verbal on the content of these reports and this must be obtained from your legal representative. 7. Whilst we take care in preparing these 

reports, a buyer should ensure that his/her legal representative confirms as soon as possible all matters relating to title including the extent 

and boundaries of the property and other important matters before exchange of contracts. 

William H Brown  is a trading name of Sequence (UK) Limited which is registered in England and Wales under company number 4268443, Registered Office is Cumbria 

House, 16-20 Hockliffe Street, Leighton Buzzard, Bedfordshire, LU7 1GN.  VAT Registration Number is 500 2481 05.   


