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welcome to  

Cardigan Road,Leeds 

This four-bedroom mid-terrace home offers spacious living, front and back gardens, and great transport links to Leeds city centre. With a large 

lounge, dining room, and two bathrooms, it's ideal for families seeking comfort and convenience near Headingley and local amenities. 

 

   

   



 

 

 

 
check out more properties at williamhbrown.co.uk 

 

Lounge 
15' 10" max x 11' 10" max ( 4.83m max x 3.61m max ) 
This spacious lounge features a large bay window at 
the front, allowing plenty of natural light to flood the 
room. The high ceilings enhance the sense of 
openness, while the carpeted flooring adds warmth 
and comfort. A radiator provides efficient heating, 
making this a cozy yet bright living space with great 
potential. 
 
 
Dining Room 
14' 10" max x 10' 1" max ( 4.52m max x 3.07m max ) 
This bright and spacious dining room features 
laminate flooring, providing a sleek and modern feel. 
A radiator ensures warmth and comfort, while the 
large rear-facing window allows plenty of natural 
light to flow in. With high ceilings enhancing the 
sense of openness, there’s ample space for 
freestanding furniture, making it a versatile and 
inviting area for dining and entertaining. 
 
 
Downstairs Bathroom 
This downstairs wet room is designed for 
convenience, featuring an electric shower, wall-hung 
sink, and toilet, creating a sleek and space-saving 
layout. A side-facing window brings in natural light, 
while electric heating ensures comfort all year round. 
Ideal for practicality and ease of use. 
 
 
Kitchen 
11' 10" max x 9' 5" max ( 3.61m max x 2.87m max ) 
This spacious kitchen features lino flooring, tiled 
walls, and a side-facing window above a metal sink. 
Equipped with laminate units, worktops, a 
freestanding fridge freezer and oven, it offers ample 
storage and workspace. A radiator provides warmth, 
while a rear door allows easy outdoor access. 
 
 
Utility Room 
10' 7" max x 5' 2" max ( 3.23m max x 1.57m max ) 
This practical utility room features lino flooring for 

easy maintenance, a side-facing window for natural 
light, and ample space for freestanding appliances. A 
radiator ensures warmth, making it a functional and 
convenient addition to the home. 
 
 
Bedroom 1 
15' 7" max x 13'  max ( 4.75m max x 3.96m max ) 
This generous double bedroom boasts laminate 
flooring for a sleek, modern finish and three front-
facing windows, flooding the space with natural light. 
The high ceilings enhance the sense of openness, 
while ample space for freestanding furniture allows 
for versatile layout options, making this a bright and 
inviting retreat. 
 
 
Bedroom 2 
14' 10" max x 10' 2" max ( 4.52m max x 3.10m max ) 
This comfortable double bedroom features carpeted 
flooring for warmth and coziness, along with a rear-
facing window that brings in natural light. The high 
ceilings add to the spacious feel, while a radiator 
ensures a cozy atmosphere. With ample space for 
freestanding furniture, this room offers great 
flexibility in layout and design. 
 
 
Bedroom 3 
15' 3" into alcove x 12' 2" into alcove ( 4.65m into alcove x 
3.71m into alcove ) 
This spacious double bedroom features an extended 
dormer, adding extra height and light to the space. 
Two rear-facing windows brighten the room, 
complementing the cozy carpeted flooring. The 
angled walls create a unique and inviting 
atmosphere, while ample space for freestanding 
furniture allows for flexible design options. Perfect 
for a comfortable and stylish retreat. 
 
 
Bedroom 4 
14' 5" into bay x 13'  into bay ( 4.39m into bay x 3.96m into 
bay ) 
This inviting double bedroom features carpeted 

flooring for added warmth and comfort. A front-
facing window fills the space with natural light, while 
angled walls add character and dimension. With 
ample space for freestanding furniture, this room 
offers flexibility for a cozy and stylish setup 
 
 
Bathroom 
This modern bathroom features lino flooring for easy 
maintenance, along with a panel bath and shower for 
versatility and comfort. A sleek wall-hung sink unit 
adds to the contemporary style, complemented by 
tall towel rails for practicality. A rear-facing window 
allows natural light to brighten the space, while an 
extractor fan ensures proper ventilation, making this 
a functional and stylish retreat. 
 
 
Storage Room 
9' 6" max x 6' 3" max ( 2.90m max x 1.91m max ) 
This spacious first-floor storage room features 
laminate flooring for durability and easy upkeep. A 
boiler mounted on the wall adds functionality, while 
a side-facing window provides natural light. With 
ample space, it's a practical and versatile storage 
area. 
 
 
Loft Space 
Loft hatch is located on the second floor, not 
boarded 
 
Garden/Parking 
Front Garden - This spacious front garden offers a 
versatile outdoor area, featuring decking for 
relaxation and turf roll adding greenery to the 
entrance. Fully fenced all around, it provides privacy 
and security, while concrete steps lead up to the 
property, adding practicality to the layout. A well-
sized space with great potential for landscaping or 
personalization. 
 
Rear Garden - This low-maintenance rear garden 
features a concreted floor, providing a practical 
outdoor space. A convenient outdoor tap adds 
functionality, while a gas meter is neatly positioned 



 

 

 

 

1. MONEY LAUNDERING REGULATIONS Intending purchasers will be asked to produce identification documentation at a later stage and we 

would ask for your co-operation in order that there is no delay in agreeing the sale. 2. These particulars do not constitute part or all of an 

offer or contract. 3. The measurements indicated are supplied for guidance only and as such must be considered incorrect. Potential buyers 

are advised to recheck measurements before committing to any expense. 4. We have not tested any apparatus, equipment, fixtures or 

services and it is in the buyers interest to check the working condition of any appliances. 5. Where an EPC, or a Home Report (Scotland only) 

is held for this property, it is available for inspection at the branch by appointment. If you require a printed version of a Home Report, you 

will need to pay a reasonable production charge reflecting printing and other costs. 6. We are not able to offer an opinion either written or 

verbal on the content of these reports and this must be obtained from your legal representative. 7. Whilst we take care in preparing these 

reports, a buyer should ensure that his/her legal representative confirms as soon as possible all matters relating to title including the extent 

and boundaries of the property and other important matters before exchange of contracts. 

William H Brown  is a trading name of Sequence (UK) Limited which is registered in England and Wales under company number 4268443, Registered Office is Cumbria 

House, 16-20 Hockliffe Street, Leighton Buzzard, Bedfordshire, LU7 1GN.  VAT Registration Number is 500 2481 05.   

 

 0113 278 5337 

 
Headingley@williamhbrown.co.uk 

 

1a Arndale Centre, Otley Road, LEEDS, West 

Yorkshire, LS6 2UE 

 williamhbrown.co.uk  

welcome to 

Cardigan Road, Leeds 

• Guide Price £260,000 - £270,000 

• 4 Bedroom Midterraced Property 

• Front & Rear Garden 

• On Street Parking 

• The property has planning permission to change into 

two self cont flats 
 

Tenure: Freehold EPC Rating: D 

Council Tax Band: C    

 
 

 

 

guide price  

£260,000 
 

 

Please note the marker reflects the 

postcode not the actual property 

 

 

  

Property Ref: 

HEA109209 - 0003 

 

check out more properties at williamhbrown.co.uk 

 


