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welcome to  

Norton Street, Grantham 

*GUIDE PRICE £130,000 - £140,000* - THREE BEDROOM traditional terrace house located close to the town centre. Ideal for first time buyers, or as a 

rental opportunity with a return of approx £875 to £900 pcm.  

 

   

   



 

 

 

 
view this property online  williamhbrown.co.uk/Property/GST113134 

 

Entrance 

Front door leading into the spacious hallway, with 
stairs to the first floor and doors leading off to the 
dining room and the lounge. 
 

Lounge 

11' 1" x 12' 9" ( 3.38m x 3.89m ) 

With feature fireplace with inset gas fire. Window to 
the front aspect, radiator to one wall. 
 

Dining Room  
11' 11" x 12' 5" ( 3.63m x 3.78m ) 

With a window to the rear aspect, this spacious 
dining room has a door leading down to the cellar,  
radiator, and doors leading to a very sizeable walk in 
storage cupboard and kitchen.  
 

Walk In Storage 

From the dining room this extra room/storage space 
benefits from a radiator and has the potential to be 
used as a study or office space. 
 

Cellar 

12' 9" x 11' 11" ( 3.89m x 3.63m ) 

This large 'living room' sized cellar has a window to 
the front aspect, and featuring a brick fireplace, brick 
walls and carpet to the floor. The vendor advises that 
this room benefits from dpc flooring, lighting, and 
cabling for power sockets. This room has the 
potential to be used as additional living space 
(subject to planning if required) music room, games 
room or a gym. 
 

Kitchen  
11' 5" x 6' 6" ( 3.48m x 1.98m ) 

This good size galley kitchen has a range of wood 
effect units at both floor and eye level with white 
worktops over, black sink and drainer. Built-in electric 
oven, microwave and gas hob. Integrated fridge. 
Space for appliances and plumbing for an automatic 
washing machine, radiator, wood effect laminate 
flooring, wall mounted boiler and part glazed door 
leading out to the rear garden. 

 

Bathroom  
6' 2" x 6'  ( 1.88m x 1.83m ) 

Comprising of a bath with a shower over, low level 
wc and pedestal wash hand basin, radiator and 
obscure window to the rear aspect.  
 

First Floor Landing  
Spacious first floor landing with carpet, radiator and 
doors leading off to the bedrooms. 
 

Bedroom One  
11' 11" x 16' 9" ( 3.63m x 5.11m ) 

This good size double bedroom has a window to the 
front aspect, radiator and carpet. 
 

Bedroom Two  
9' 8" x 8' 1" ( 2.95m x 2.46m ) 

A second good size double bedroom with a window 
to the rear aspect, radiator and carpet. 
 

Bedroom Three 

15'  x 6' 4" ( 4.57m x 1.93m ) 

Bedroom three has a window to the rear aspect, 
radiator and carpet. 
 

 

Description Outside 

To the front of the property there is a small garden 
area with a gated frontage. 
To the rear there is a lovely garden with a patio area, 
perfect for outside dining, lawn, shed to be included, 
wall to one side and fencing to the other side and 
rear. Gated access leading to the passageway. 
 
 

 



 

 

 

 

1. MONEY LAUNDERING REGULATIONS Intending purchasers will be asked to produce identification documentation at a later stage and we 

would ask for your co-operation in order that there is no delay in agreeing the sale. 2. These particulars do not constitute part or all of an 

offer or contract. 3. The measurements indicated are supplied for guidance only and as such must be considered incorrect. Potential buyers 

are advised to recheck measurements before committing to any expense. 4. We have not tested any apparatus, equipment, fixtures or 

services and it is in the buyers interest to check the working condition of any appliances. 5. Where an EPC, or a Home Report (Scotland only) 

is held for this property, it is available for inspection at the branch by appointment. If you require a printed version of a Home Report, you 

will need to pay a reasonable production charge reflecting printing and other costs. 6. We are not able to offer an opinion either written or 

verbal on the content of these reports and this must be obtained from your legal representative. 7. Whilst we take care in preparing these 

reports, a buyer should ensure that his/her legal representative confirms as soon as possible all matters relating to title including the extent 

and boundaries of the property and other important matters before exchange of contracts. 

William H Brown  is a trading name of Sequence (UK) Limited which is registered in England and Wales under company number 4268443, Registered Office is Cumbria 

House, 16-20 Hockliffe Street, Leighton Buzzard, Bedfordshire, LU7 1GN.  VAT Registration Number is 500 2481 05.   

 

 01476 566363 

 
Grantham@williamhbrown.co.uk 

 

63 High Street, GRANTHAM, Lincolnshire, 

NG31 6NN 

 williamhbrown.co.uk  

welcome to 

Norton Street, Grantham 

• THREE BEDROOM TRADITIONAL TERRACE HOUSE 

• WALKING DISTANCE TO THE TRAIN STATION 

• IDEAL FOR COMMUTERS OR FIRST TIME BUYERS 

• OR A GREAT RENTAL AT APPROX £875 - £900 PCM 

• LOUNGE AND DINING ROOM 
 

Tenure: Freehold EPC Rating: C 
 

 

 

guide price  

£130,000 - £140,000 
 

 

 

 

 

 

Please note the marker reflects the 

postcode not the actual property 

 

 

   

Property Ref: 

GST113134 - 0005 

 

view this property online  williamhbrown.co.uk/Property/GST113134 

 

 

 


