
The Cottage The Green,Palgrave Diss IP22 1AG 

 

 



 
 

 

 

 

 

 

welcome to  

The Cottage The Green, Palgrave Diss 

A period character property set in an amazing location overlooking the green within the village and within walking distance to amenities. The 

property boasts from two reception rooms, shaker style kitchen, four generous bedrooms and family bathroom. 

Location 

Palgrave is a small village on the borders of Suffolk 
and Norfolk. It has been considered a 'hot spot' for 
many years for housing, combining a village lifestyle 
with easy access to the wider world having a 
mainline rail service just one mile away on the 
Norwich to London Liverpool Street line with a 
journey time to London of around 90 minutes. The 
village is centred on its green and duck pond and 
has a well-regarded Primary school, catchment area 
for Hartismere High School with a bus from the 
centre of the village and fine church at its centre. For 
wider amenities the thriving market town of Diss is 
less than a mile away via a public footpath and has a 
good range of local and national shops, various 
supermarkets, sporting facilities for all ages and 
abilities including rugby, tennis, cricket, squash, 
football and bowls clubs, modern health centre.  
 

Entrance Hall  
Window to front aspect, radiator, tiled flooring.  
 

Cloakroom  
Window to side aspect, W/C, wash hand basin.  
 

Lounge 

14' 5" x 13' 7" ( 4.39m x 4.14m ) 

Dual aspect windows, two radiators, wood burner, 
wooden flooring. 
 

Dining Room  
14'  x 10' 2" ( 4.27m x 3.10m ) 

Window to front aspect, radiator, brick feature 
fireplace. 
 

Kitchen  
10' 2" x 7' 8" ( 3.10m x 2.34m ) 

Rear aspect glazed window, rear door, fitted kitchen 
with wall and base units, work surfaces, tiled splash 

back, sink, integrated oven and gas hob, space for 
fridge freezer, radiator, wooden stair case leading to 
the first floor. 
 

Bedroom 1  
15' 10" x 9' 4" ( 4.83m x 2.84m ) 

Dual aspect window including two Velux windows to 
rear, radiator, exposed beams, wooden flooring.  
 

Bedroom 2 

13' 6" x 10' 3" ( 4.11m x 3.12m ) 

Window to front aspect, radiator, wooden flooring.  
 

Bedroom 3  
14' 7" x 10' 2" Max ( 4.45m x 3.10m Max ) 

Window to front aspect, radiator, loft hatch, feature 
fire place, wooden flooring. 
 

Bedroom 4  
7' 8" x 13' 10" Max ( 2.34m x 4.22m Max ) 

Window to rear aspect, radiator, wooden flooring. 
 

Bathroom  
8' 11" x 4' 7" ( 2.72m x 1.40m ) 

Window to rear aspect, W/C, radiator, paneled bath, 
cupboard with boiler, wooden flooring. 
 

Outside 

To the rear of the property is a low maintenance 
courtyard with various potted flowers and side 
gated access. 
 

Parking 

Space at the front of the property - not allocated.  
 



 

 

 

 

 

 



 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 01379 644719 

 
Diss@williamhbrown.co.uk 

 

1 Navire House Mere Street, DISS, Norfolk, 

IP22 4AG 

 williamhbrown.co.uk  

welcome to 

The Cottage The Green, 

Palgrave Diss 

• Semi-detached Period Cottage 

• Four Generous Sized Bedrooms 

• Enclosed Low Maintenance Courtyard 

• Situated Within Walking Distance To Diss Town Centre 

• Property Overlooking The Village Green 
 

Tenure: Freehold EPC Rating: E 

Council Tax Band: C    

 
 
 

 

  

£280,000 
 

 

 

 

 

 

Property Ref: 

DSS111200 - 0003 

 

view this property online  williamhbrown.co.uk/Property/DSS111200 

1. MONEY LAUNDERING REGULATIONS Intending purchasers will be asked to produce identification documentation at a later stage and we 

would ask for your co-operation in order that there is no delay in agreeing the sale. 2. These particulars do not constitute part or all of an 

offer or contract. 3. The measurements indicated are supplied for guidance only and as such must be considered incorrect. Potential buyers 

are advised to recheck measurements before committing to any expense. 4. We have not tested any apparatus, equipment, fixtures or 

services and it is in the buyers interest to check the working condition of any appliances. 5. Where an EPC, or a Home Report (Scotland only) 

is held for this property, it is available for inspection at the branch by appointment. If you require a printed version of a Home Report, you 

will need to pay a reasonable production charge reflecting printing and other costs. 6. We are not able to offer an opinion either written or 

verbal on the content of these reports and this must be obtained from your legal representative. 7. Whilst we take care in preparing these 

reports, a buyer should ensure that his/her legal representative confirms as soon as possible all matters relating to title including the extent 

and boundaries of the property and other important matters before exchange of contracts. 

William H Brown  is a trading name of Sequence (UK) Limited which is registered in England and Wales under company number 4268443, Registered Office is Cumbria 

House, 16-20 Hockliffe Street, Leighton Buzzard, Bedfordshire, LU7 1GN.  VAT Registration Number is 500 2481 05.   

 


