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welcome to  

Swaffham Road, Wendling, Dereham 

>> NO ONWARD CHAIN! A detached 4-bed bungalow in a non-estate village, set on a glorious plot with superb gardens, ponds & countryside 

views surrounding. Spacious, versatile & full of potential. Easy access to A47 routes and boasting 2 reception rooms & ample parking!  

   

   



 

 

 

 
view this property online  williamhbrown.co.uk/Property/DRM115495 

 

Description 
We are delighted to welcome to the market this 
detached bungalow, set in a non-estate position 
within a peaceful village. The home offers fantastic 
potential for modernisation and enhancement, 
making it a perfect opportunity for buyers looking to 
create their dream home.  
 
The property offers versatile living accommodation 
currently arranged to include four adaptable 
bedrooms, charming lounge complete with wood 
burner, separate dining room, fitted kitchen, family 
bathroom and a separate shower suite. Outside, the 
bungalow sits on a generous plot with a private, 
wrap-around garden - a true highlight of this home. 
The garden features sprawling lawn, patio, shingle, 
and is beautifully planted with a variety of mature 
plants and trees. The home further benefits from a 
shingle driveway which provides ample off-road 
parking.  
 
With ample room to extend or reconfiguration (stpp), 
and located in a desirable village setting surrounded 
by countryside charm, this is a rare opportunity to 
secure a spacious, detached home with plenty of 
potential - NO ONWARD CHAIN! 
 
The Accommodation  
Double glazed external entrance door opening to;  
 

Entrance Hall  
Fitted carpet flooring, radiator, doors opening to all 
bedrooms and opening to;  
 

Lounge 

18' 4" x 10'  ( 5.59m x 3.05m ) 

Fitted carpet flooring, central log burner with tiled 
hearth and exposed brick surround, radiator, two 
double glazed windows to side aspect and door 
opening to;  
 

Inner Hallway  
Fitted carpet flooring, door opening to kitchen and 
further door opening to;  
 

Dining Room 

11' 3" x 10' 2" ( 3.43m x 3.10m ) 

Fitted carpet flooring, built-in storage cupboard, 
radiator and double glazed window to rear aspect.  
 

Kitchen 

14' 8" x 12' 2" ( 4.47m x 3.71m ) 

A wide range of wall and floor mounted base units 
with complementary rolled edge work surfaces over, 
inset 1.5 sink with mixer tap, tiled splashbacks, space 
for electric cooker, extractor hood, space for fridge 
freezer, space for dishwasher, space for washing 
machine, tiled flooring, radiator, double glazed 
window to side aspect and door opening to;  
 

Rear Lobby  
Fitted carpet flooring, double glazed external door 
opening to the side aspect, door opening to shower 
room and further door opening to;  
 

Bathroom  
Three piece suite comprising low level w.c, pedestal 
hand wash basin, panelled bath, tiled splashbacks, 
tiled flooring, airing cupboard housing hot water 
tank, radiator and double glazed obscure glass 
window to rear aspect.  
 

Separate Shower Suite  
One piece suite comprising walk-in shower cubicle, 
tiled walls and tiled flooring.  
 

Bedroom One 

13'  x 8' 10" ( 3.96m x 2.69m ) 

Fitted carpet flooring, built-in wardrobes, radiator, 
double glazed window to front aspect and double 
glazed bay window to side aspect.   
 

Bedroom Two 

10' 1" x 7' 9" ( 3.07m x 2.36m ) 

Fitted carpet flooring, built-in wardrobe, radiator and 
double glazed window to side aspect.  
 

Bedroom Three 

10' 1" x 7' 4" ( 3.07m x 2.24m ) 

Fitted carpet flooring, radiator and double glazed 
window to front aspect.  
 

Bedroom Four 

10'  x 7' 2" ( 3.05m x 2.18m ) 

Fitted carpet flooring, radiator and double glazed 
window to 

 

External  
The front of the home is enclosed by brick walling 
with gated entry leading to the main entrance. A 
shingle driveway to the side leads to the driveway 
which provides ample off-road parking for up to 4 
cars.  
 
The property is set on a generous plot and boasts a 
truly fantastic, fully enclosed, wrap-around rear 
garden - perfect for relaxing, entertaining, or simply 
enjoying outdoors. Stretching across the rear, the 
garden features a well-maintained lawn, patio areas, 
and a shingle section. Beautifully stocked with a 
variety of mature plants and established trees, the 
garden is rich is colour and texture throughout the 
seasons. Two tranquil ponds add a peaceful, natural 
charm to the space. Additional highlights include a 
storage shed and a greenhouse, offering practicality 
for garden enthusiasts.  
 

Location  
Wendling is a sought after mid-Norfolk village 
boasting a peaceful setting throughout with 
surrounding countryside views and walks. Benefiting 
from being just a short drive away from Scarning, 
Little Fransham offering local amenities. Dereham 
and Norwich City Centre are easily accessed too from 
great transport links, both of which offer an 
abundance of amenities such as shops, 
supermarkets, restaurants and schools for all ages 
making it a fantastic location.  
 



 

 

 

 

 

 

1. MONEY LAUNDERING REGULATIONS Intending purchasers will be asked to produce identification documentation at a later stage and we 

would ask for your co-operation in order that there is no delay in agreeing the sale. 2. These particulars do not constitute part or all of an offer 

or contract. 3. The measurements indicated are supplied for guidance only and as such must be considered incorrect. Potential buyers are 

advised to recheck measurements before committing to any expense. 4. We have not tested any apparatus, equipment, fixtures or services and 

it is in the buyers interest to check the working condition of any appliances. 5. Where an EPC, or a Home Report (Scotland only) is held for this 

property, it is available for inspection at the branch by appointment. If you require a printed version of a Home Report, you will need to pay a 

reasonable production charge reflecting printing and other costs. 6. We are not able to offer an opinion either written or verbal on the content 

of these reports and this must be obtained from your legal representative. 7. Whilst we take care in preparing these reports, a buyer should 

ensure that his/her legal representative confirms as soon as possible all matters relating to title including the extent and boundaries of the 

property and other important matters before exchange of contracts. 

William H Brown  is a trading name of Sequence (UK) Limited which is registered in England and Wales under company number 4268443, Registered Office is Cumbria 

House, 16-20 Hockliffe Street, Leighton Buzzard, Bedfordshire, LU7 1GN.  VAT Registration Number is 500 2481 05.   

 

 01362 692238 

 
Dereham@williamhbrown.co.uk 
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welcome to 

Swaffham Road, Wendling, Dereham 

• Detached Bungalow With 4 Adaptable Bedrooms - 

No Onward Chain! 

• Set On A Generous Plot With Excellent Scope For 

Enhancement 

• Ideal For Modernisation And Personalisation 

• Oil Fired Central Heating And Double Glazed 

Windows 

• Charming Lounge With Central Wood Burner 

• Fantastic Garden, Featuring Established Plants, 

Ponds And Sheds  

• Ample Off-Road Parking  

• Surrounded by Beautiful Countryside 
 

Tenure: Freehold EPC Rating: E 

Council Tax Band: C    

£375,000 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Please note the marker reflects the 

postcode not the actual property 

   

Property Ref: 

DRM115495 - 0002 

 

view this property online  williamhbrown.co.uk/Property/DRM115495 

 

 

 


