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welcome to  

Lamberts Close, Feltwell Thetford 

This detached bungalow is MORE SPACIOUS THAN MEETS THE EYE! There are TWO DOUBLE BEDROOMS, plus a kitchen diner and complimented by 

the large living room. Found in the popular village of Feltwell, the property is sold with NO ONWARD CHAIN, so call now to book a viewing. 

 

 

Summary 
Looking for a low maintenance bungalow? Look no 
further as this well presented property is ready to 
move into! The bungalow is found on the edge of 
Feltwell which is a popular Norfolk village bustling 
with life. 
 
The property itself enjoys a well spaced out 
accommodation that offers a 18'3 Kitchen Diner, 
living room to front aspect plus Two Double 
Bedrooms and a Four Piece Bathroom Suite! 
 
INTERNAL VIEWING IS HIGHLY RECOMMENDED! 
 
The Accommodation 

Entrance door to: 
 

Living Room 

14' 4" x 15' 4" ( 4.37m x 4.67m ) 

With electric fireplace, air conditioning unit, window 
to front and radiator.  
 

Kitchen / Diner 

18' 3" x 10' 4" ( 5.56m x 3.15m ) 

With a range of wall and base units with worktop 
over, sink unit with mixer tap over, space and point 
for electric cooker, space and plumbing for washing 
machine, space for fridge/freezer, boiler cupboard, 
dual aspect windows to both the front and side, 
door to side and radiator.  
 

Inner Hall 
With built in storage cupboard.  
 

Bedroom One 

13' 5" to wardrobe. x 8' 11" ( 4.09m to wardrobe. x 2.72m ) 

With built in wardrobe, air conditioning unit, door to 
rear garden and two radiators.  
 

Bedroom Two 

12' 8" x 9'  ( 3.86m x 2.74m ) 

With window to rear and radiator.  
 

Bathroom 

With W.C, wash hand basin with mixer tap over, 
panelled bath, shower cubicle with shower 
attachment over, underfloor heating and window to 
rear.   
 

Outside 
 
Front Garden 
To the front of the property is a garden which is 
largely laid to shingle with a paved driveway which 
provides off road parking space and access to the 
Garage.  
 

Rear Garden 
To the rear of the property is an enclosed garden 
which is largely laid to lawn with a timber deck area 
and path and gate to the side.  
 

 



 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
check out more properties at williamhbrown.co.uk 

 

 



 

 

 

directions to this property:  

 
From the William H Brown office on Brandon's High Street, 

proceed along the High Street and head out of Brandon, 

bearing left just after the train crossing. Continue along 

Brandon Road and head into the village of Weeting. Proceed 

along Lynn Road and head out of the village. Take a right at the 

T junction onto Old Feltwell Road and then a left onto Munsons 

Lane. Here you will take a further left onto Lamberts Close and 

proceed, where you will find the property.  

 

welcome to 

Lamberts Close, Feltwell, Thetford 

 Chain Free Sale 

 Detached Bungalow 

 Two Double Bedrooms 

 Spacious 18'3 Kitchen Diner 

 Living Room to Front Aspect 

 Private Rear Garden 

 Driveway Parking and Garage 
 

Tenure: Freehold EPC Rating: D 
 

 

 Offers in Excess of 

£230,000 
 

 

 

 

check out more properties at williamhbrown.co.uk 

 

 01842 811058 

 
Brandon@williamhbrown.co.uk 

 

18-20 High Street, BRANDON, Suffolk, IP27 

0AQ 

 
williamhbrown.co.uk  

Property Ref: 

BRD110052 - 0001 

 

 

 
 

 
1. MONEY LAUNDERING REGULATIONS Intending purchasers will be asked to produce identification documentation at a later stage and we 

would ask for your co-operation in order that there is no delay in agreeing the sale. 2. These particulars do not constitute part or all of an 

offer or contract. 3. The measurements indicated are supplied for guidance only and as such must be considered incorrect. Potential buyers 

are advised to recheck measurements before committing to any expense. 4. We have not tested any apparatus, equipment, fixtures or 

services and it is in the buyers interest to check the working condition of any appliances. 5. Where an EPC, or a Home Report (Scotland only) 

is held for this property, it is available for inspection at the branch by appointment. If you require a printed version of a Home Report, you 

will need to pay a reasonable production charge reflecting printing and other costs. 6. We are not able to offer an opinion either written or 

verbal on the content of these reports and this must be obtained from your legal representative. 7. Whilst we take care in preparing these 

reports, a buyer should ensure that his/her legal representative confirms as soon as possible all matters relating to title including the extent 

and boundaries of the property and other important matters before exchange of contracts. 

William H Brown  is a trading name of Sequence (UK) Limited which is registered in England and Wales under company number 4268443, Registered Office is Cumbria 

House, 16-20 Hockliffe Street, Leighton Buzzard, Bedfordshire, LU7 1GN.  VAT Registration Number is 500 2481 05.   

 


