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welcome to  

Millgate Street, Methwold, Thetford 

This cottage is situated centrally within the popular village of Methwold and whilst being in need of improvements, upgrades and renovation, there is 

PLENTY OF POTENTIAL HERE! In brief, there are three bedrooms, 21'5 Living Room plus a private garden with BARN/OUTBUILDING. CALL NOW TO 

VIEW! 

 

 

 

Summary 
Located on a quiet residential street, this detached 
character cottage is definitely worthy of a viewing! 
 
The village of Methwold itself benefits from a range 
of immediate amenities, including a Post Office, fish 
and chip shop, both a primary and a secondary 
school, pub and playing field, all whilst being just a 
short commute away from the market town of 
Brandon, with access to further local amenities, 
including supermarkets and a main train line with 
direct links to Cambridge and Norwich. 
 
Inside, the home has spacious accommodation 
throughout and has retained a lovely, characterful 
feel that will truly make you feel at home as soon as 
you walk through the front door.  An entrance porch 
takes you into a lengthy, yet cosy, living room, with 
plenty of space for dining too and a well equipped 
kitchen on the ground floor. 
 
To the first floor, you'll find three proportionate 
bedrooms, with the larger two having plenty of built 
in wardrobes for storage, and a family bathroom, 
creating a lovely space for an already grown family 
or those looking towards the future and expanding 
further. 
 
To the rear, the garden also offers great space and is 
a blank canvas, ready for the new owner to easily 
come in and mould to suit their individual needs.  
Plus, with the handy barn/outbuilding here, there is 
great practicality too! 
 
 
 
 
 
 

The Accommodation 

Entrance door to: 
 

Entrance Porch 

7' 2" x 5' 11" ( 2.18m x 1.80m ) 

Currently being used as a study, with a door to the 
front.  
 

Lounge / Diner 

11' 7" max. x 21' 5" max. ( 3.53m max. x 6.53m max. ) 

With exposed beams, wooden flooring, stairs to first 
floor landing, three windows to front, window to 
rear and two radiators.  
 

Kitchen 

With a range of fitted kitchen units at wall and base 
level with work surface over, space and point for 
electric oven with cooker hood over, space and 
plumbing for washing machine, sink units with taps 
over, space and plumbing for dishwasher, floor 
mounted boiler, triple aspect windows with two to 
the side and one to the rear, stone flooring and 
stable door to the rear garden.  
 

First Floor Landing 

Being split level, with dual aspect windows to both 
the rear and side.  
 

Bedroom One 

9' 6" x 11' 7" max. ( 2.90m x 3.53m max. ) 

With built in wardrobes, window to front and 
radiator.  
 

Bedroom Two 

13'  max. x 8' 11" max. ( 3.96m max. x 2.72m max. ) 

With window to front and radiator.  
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Bedroom Three 

8' 7" x 8' 2" ( 2.62m x 2.49m ) 

With built in storage cupboard, access to the loft 
space, window to side and radiator.  
 

Bathroom 

With W.C, wash hand basin with mixer tap over, bath 
with taps and shower attachment over, window to 
side and radiator.  
 

Outside 
 

Front Garden 

To the front of the property is a double gate which 
opens up to the driveway and leads you to: 
 

Barn / Garage 

Which is currently being used as a gym, with power 
and light connected.  
 

Rear Garden 

To the rear of the property is a garden which is 
mainly laid to lawn with a range of plants and 
shrubs throughout , external oil tank, outside tap, 
car port and a shed, which has power and light 
connected.  
 



 

 

 

 

 

 

 

welcome to 

Millgate Street, Methwold, Thetford 

• Renovation Potential! 

• Detached Cottage 

• Central Village Location 

• Three Bedrooms 

• Barn/Outbuildings 

• Enclosed Garden 

• Off Road Parking & Car Port 

• Call Now to View! 
 

Tenure: Freehold EPC Rating: E 
 
 

 

  

£250,000 
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 01842 811058 

 
Brandon@williamhbrown.co.uk 

 

18-20 High Street, BRANDON, Suffolk, IP27 

0AQ 

 williamhbrown.co.uk  

Property Ref: 

BRD110370 - 0002 

 

1. MONEY LAUNDERING REGULATIONS Intending purchasers will be asked to produce identification documentation at a later stage and we 

would ask for your co-operation in order that there is no delay in agreeing the sale. 2. These particulars do not constitute part or all of an 

offer or contract. 3. The measurements indicated are supplied for guidance only and as such must be considered incorrect. Potential buyers 

are advised to recheck measurements before committing to any expense. 4. We have not tested any apparatus, equipment, fixtures or 

services and it is in the buyers interest to check the working condition of any appliances. 5. Where an EPC, or a Home Report (Scotland only) 

is held for this property, it is available for inspection at the branch by appointment. If you require a printed version of a Home Report, you 

will need to pay a reasonable production charge reflecting printing and other costs. 6. We are not able to offer an opinion either written or 

verbal on the content of these reports and this must be obtained from your legal representative. 7. Whilst we take care in preparing these 

reports, a buyer should ensure that his/her legal representative confirms as soon as possible all matters relating to title including the extent 

and boundaries of the property and other important matters before exchange of contracts. 

William H Brown  is a trading name of Sequence (UK) Limited which is registered in England and Wales under company number 4268443, Registered Office is Cumbria 

House, 16-20 Hockliffe Street, Leighton Buzzard, Bedfordshire, LU7 1GN.  VAT Registration Number is 500 2481 05.   



 
 

 

 


