
  
 

 

Hunters Cottage  Church Street  Youlgrave  Bakewell  DE45 1WL 



 
 

 

 

 

 

welcome to  

Hunters Cottage  Church Street  Youlgrave  Bakewell 
This three bedroomed semi detached cottage retains many original features, charm and character. Situated in a central position in the highly popular 

village of Youlgrave with fantastic views of All Saints Parish Church. The cottage offers spacious accommodation throughout. 

   

   



 

 

 

 
view this property online  bagshawsresidential.co.uk/Property/BAK106379 

 

Entrance Porch 

Single glazed door to the front opens into the 
entrance porch. With a quarry tiled floor and a 
further single glazed door opening into the sitting 
room with a glazed side panel. 
 

Sitting Room 

15' 6" extending to 18' 3" x 14' 5" Plus Bag ( 4.72m 

extending to 5.56m x 4.39m Plus Bag ) 

The main focal point of this charming sitting room is 
the log burning stove which sits on a tiled hearth and 
brick surround. The room has exposed beams to the 
ceiling, a double glazed window to the front, a 
central heating radiator and a useful storage 
cupboard under the stairs. The sitting room is 
finished with laminate flooring and the open 
staircase gives access to the first floor 
accommodation. 
 

Inner Lobby Area 

The inner lobby area gives access to the downstairs 
WC and the kitchen. 
 

Downstairs Wc 

Having a low flush WC, wash hand basin and 
extractor fan. There is also a useful built-in storage 
cupboard with shelving. 
 

Dining Kitchen 

11' 6" x 10' 7" ( 3.51m x 3.23m ) 

The dining kitchen features a range of wall and base 
units with a stainless steel sink inset into the work 
surfaces. There is space for a gas range and a 
refrigerator. The kitchen has a stone flag floor, space 
for a dining table and a central heating radiator.  A 
single glazed window with exposed stonework looks 
into the rear entrance porch/utility room. 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Rear Entrance Porch/utility 

10' 8" x 4' 9" ( 3.25m x 1.45m ) 

This utility area has a space for a washing machine 
and a dryer. There are quarry tiles to the floor and a 
wall mounted Worcester Bosch boiler. There is a 
single glazed window which provides views of the 
rear garden and a double glazed painted wooden 
door opens onto the rear. There is also single glazed 
window which looks into the dining kitchen. 
 

Landing 

Landing has a storage area under the stairs and 
exposed beams to the ceiling. 
 

Bedroom One 

11' 4" at the max x 9' 3" at the max ( 3.45m at the max x 

2.82m at the max ) 

Bedroom one has a double glazed window, stripped 
wooden flooring, a built in wardrobe with storage 
overhead and a central heating radiator. 
 

Bedroom Two 

11' 3" x 10' 4" plus alcove ( 3.43m x 3.15m plus alcove ) 

Bedroom two has a central heating radiator and a 
double glazed window and access to attic via a 
hatch. 
 

Bedroom Three 

9' 4" x 10' 1" ( 2.84m x 3.07m ) 

There is a double glazed window to the front 
elevation, a built in wardrobe and central heating 
radiator. 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Family Bathroom 

Comprising of a bath having shower over, low flush 
WC and a wash handbasin with storage beneath. 
There are two useful storage cupboards, a central 
heating radiator, stripped wooden flooring, exposed 
beams to the ceiling and a double glazed opaque 
window to the side elevation. 
 

Attic Area 

Access via a fixed ladder from the landing is the attic 
area. There is a double glazed skylight, built in 
storage, spot lights and a central heating radiator 
located in this area. 
 

Exterior 

To the rear of the property there is a good sized 
garden/yard with a patio, raised borders and 
limestone boundary walling. To the rear of the 
garden there is a good sized stone workshop which 
could be used for a variety of purposes and a further 
charming stone store/ storage area which is currently 
used as a greenhouse.  
 



 

 

 

 

1. MONEY LAUNDERING REGULATIONS Intending purchasers will be asked to produce identification documentation at a later stage and we 

would ask for your co-operation in order that there is no delay in agreeing the sale. 2. These particulars do not constitute part or all of an offer or 

contract. 3. The measurements indicated are supplied for guidance only and as such must be considered incorrect. Potential buyers are advised to 

recheck measurements before committing to any expense. 4. We have not tested any apparatus, equipment, fixtures or services and it is in the 

buyers interest to check the working condition of any appliances. 5. Where an EPC, or a Home Report (Scotland only) is held for this property, it is 

available for inspection at the branch by appointment. If you require a printed version of a Home Report, you will need to pay a reasonable 

production charge reflecting printing and other costs. 6. We are not able to offer an opinion either written or verbal on the content of these 

reports and this must be obtained from your legal representative. 7. Whilst we take care in preparing these reports, a buyer should ensure that 

his/her legal representative confirms as soon as possible all matters relating to title including the extent and boundaries of the property and other 

important matters before exchange of contracts. 

Bagshaws Residential  is a trading name of Sequence (UK) Limited which is registered in England and Wales under company number 4268443, Registered Office is Cumbria 

House, 16-20 Hockliffe Street, Leighton Buzzard, Bedfordshire, LU7 1GN.  VAT Registration Number is 500 2481 05.   
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 Bridge Street, BAKEWELL, Derbyshire, DE45 

1DS 
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welcome to 

Hunters Cottage  Church Street  Youlgrave 

Bakewell 

 Charming three bedroomed semi detached cottage 

 Situated in the heart of Youlgrave 

 Easy access to local country inns and shops 

 Catchment area of Lady Manners School 

 Beautifully presented throughout 
 

Tenure: Freehold EPC Rating: E 
 

 

  

£350,000 
 

 

 

 

 

 

Please note the marker reflects the 

postcode not the actual property 

 
 

 

 

 

   

Property Ref: 

BAK106379 - 0003 
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