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welcome to  

Rodway Road, Patchway Bristol 

This well presented two bedroom apartment will suit investors and residential buyers in equal measure, The property is light and bright with spacious 

rooms and an open outlook. The garden, private access inward and tremendously convenient location is the icing on the cake! 

Rodway Road 

Access 

The handsome building has attractive hedgerow to 
the side plus wooden fencing and herbaceous 
borders to the front. 
 
The private entrance is granted via paved pathway 
that leads along the side of the property. The 
pathway continues onward to the garden plot to the 
rear aspect. 
 

Private Entrance 

The traditional front door leads conveniently into a 
small hallway space and well presented staircase. 
Finished with carpet and wooden handrails. A side 
window from the landing illuminates this space and 
instantly accentuates the feeling of space as found 
throughout. 
 

Landing/Main Hallway 

10' 5" max x 8' 5" max ( 3.17m max x 2.57m max ) 

Well presented landing leading to all areas offering 
great proportions. As mentioned, the side aspect 
window offers plenty of natural light and helps 
create an inviting space. Finished with carpet and 
pendant light whilst offering further storage and loft 
access. 
 

Living Room 

14' 11" max x 10' 5" max ( 4.55m max x 3.17m max ) 

The main living space offers generous proportions 
with a bay window to the front aspect. The room is 
naturally light and bright and benefits from an open 
aspect given the space adjacent to the Patchway 
Council Civic building. 
 
The room is finished with carpet and includes a 
pendant light and art deco style surround and 
electric fireplace unit. Plenty of space for furniture 

and small dining table if required. 
 

Kitchen 

10' 4" max x 8' 8" max ( 3.15m max x 2.64m max ) 

The spacious kitchen offers dual aspect credentials 
given windows to the side and rear. The pretty 
outlook extends over the garden and again 
guarantees beautiful natural light and a feeling of 
space. 
 
Complete with wall and base units, stainless steel 
sink and drainer, double undercouter fridge and 
freezer PLUS integrated hob and oven. The 
condition and finish is of a high standard with tile 
effect lino flooring and quartz effect worktops. 
 
*The modern Vaillant combination boiler is located 
here which heats the house and water. 
 

Bedroom One 

12' 11" max x 10' 5" max ( 3.94m max x 3.17m max ) 

Bedroom 1 is finished to a good standard with views 
out over the garden. Complete with carpet. pendant 
light and picture rails. 
 

Bedroom Two 

8' 8" max x 8' 6" max ( 2.64m max x 2.59m max ) 

Again, presented to a clean standard with plenty of 
natural light. Bedroom two also benefits from 
extensive fitted storage against the side wall.  
 

Bathroom 

7' 3" max x 5' 3" max ( 2.21m max x 1.60m max ) 

The bathroom includes a three piece suite alongside 
attractive two tone wall tiles and central banner line. 
Here is an electric shower unit, wall mounted 
radiator and chrome handrail. A window to the side 
aspect offers light and adds to the feeling of space. 
 

Externally 

Rear Garden Plot 

The comparatively expansive rear garden plot is 
accessed via the side path. The space offers 
opportunity for the next owner and hasn't been 
used for some years. 
 

Agents Notes 

We understand from the vendor that the ground 
rent is £5 per annum. We further understand that 
there is nil formal service charge and any works are 
agreed between the two owners by mutual 
agreement. (as is insurance). The lease term is 
understood to be 999 years from 1982. 
 
*We recommend that all financial and legal 
information is checked independently by your 
chosen advisors. 
 



 

 

 

 

 

 



 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 0117 979 8082 

 
StokeGifford@allenandharris.co.uk 

 

41 North Road, Stoke Gifford, BRISTOL, BS34 

8PB 

 allenandharris.co.uk  

welcome to 

Rodway Road, 

Patchway Bristol 

• Two Bedroom Apartment - Desirable Patchway 

Location (NO CHAIN). 

• *MATTERPORT VIDEO TOUR INCLUDED* 

• Well Proportioned Rooms Throughout / Private 

Entrance Plus Staircase Leading Upwards 

• Sizable Rear Garden Plot with Private Access 

• Light and Bright with Open Outlook / Gas Central 

Heating / Double Glazing 
 

Tenure: Leasehold EPC Rating: C 
This is a Leasehold property with details as follows; Term of Lease 999 years from 24 Jun 1982.  

Should you require further information please contact the branch. Please Note additional fees 

could be incurred for items such as Leasehold packs. 
 

 

  

£180,000 
 

 

 

 

 

 

Property Ref: 

STG109570 - 0004 

 

check out more properties at allenandharris.co.uk 

1. MONEY LAUNDERING REGULATIONS Intending purchasers will be asked to produce identification documentation at a later stage and we 

would ask for your co-operation in order that there is no delay in agreeing the sale. 2. These particulars do not constitute part or all of an 

offer or contract. 3. The measurements indicated are supplied for guidance only and as such must be considered incorrect. Potential buyers 

are advised to recheck measurements before committing to any expense. 4. We have not tested any apparatus, equipment, fixtures or 

services and it is in the buyers interest to check the working condition of any appliances. 5. Where an EPC, or a Home Report (Scotland only) 

is held for this property, it is available for inspection at the branch by appointment. If you require a printed version of a Home Report, you 

will need to pay a reasonable production charge reflecting printing and other costs. 6. We are not able to offer an opinion either written or 

verbal on the content of these reports and this must be obtained from your legal representative. 7. Whilst we take care in preparing these 

reports, a buyer should ensure that his/her legal representative confirms as soon as possible all matters relating to title including the extent 

and boundaries of the property and other important matters before exchange of contracts. 

Allen & Harris  is a trading name of Sequence (UK) Limited which is registered in England and Wales under company number 4268443, Registered Office is Cumbria 

House, 16-20 Hockliffe Street, Leighton Buzzard, Bedfordshire, LU7 1GN.  VAT Registration Number is 500 2481 05.   

 


