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welcome to  

Railton Jones Close, Stoke Gifford Bristol 

This superb detached home in desirable location is light and bright benefiting from a spacious garden, detached garage and driveway. Very well 

presented throughout, offered with no chain and presented to a high standard. 

Raillton Jones Close 
Entrance 
The attractive entrance with double glazed door 
leads from the driveway offering access into the 
central hallway. 
 
Central Hallway 
11' 9" max x 6' 5" max ( 3.58m max x 1.96m max ) 
Finished in neutral colours offering access to all 
areas. The convenient downsstairs cloakroom also 
leads away from here with useful understairs storage 
ahead. Beautiful light available from both the 
kitchen and living room with a further window to 
the side aspect from the attract staircase. 
 
Cloakroom W.C. 
Well proportioned and presented to a high standard 
offering convenience and adding to the 'user-
friendly' nature of the property. 
 
Kitchen/Diner 
16' 5" max x 9' 6" max ( 5.00m max x 2.90m max ) 
The stylish kitchen diner benefits from multiple 
windows to the front aspect offering sumptuous 
light and pleasant outlook. The spacious kitchen 
easily accommodates a full kitchen with amply space 
for a dining table. The well designed kitchen further 
offers a breakfast bar with storage below. 
 
Included here is a four ring gas hob, stainless steel 
sink and drainer, Beko double oven, undercounter 
washing machine and integrated dishwasher. 
 
Living Room 
16' 6" max x 10' 10" max ( 5.03m max x 3.30m max ) 
Presented to a high standard with double doors 
leading out into the garden. The room is finished 
with twin pendant lights, neutral carpet and feature 
gas fireplace including surround and hearth. The 

space grants lovely light and promotes a feeling of 
'inside-outside' living. 
 
Staircase Leading Upwards 
Well presented and also flooded with natural light 
given the large side aspect windows. Notably wide 
treads and great ceiling height for easy access and 
home moving. 
 
Landing 
12' 3" max x 8' 9" max ( 3.73m max x 2.67m max ) 
Very well presented auditorium style landing that 
really accentuates the feeling of space as found 
throughout. 
 
Bedroom 1 
10' 6" max x 8' 7" max ( 3.20m max x 2.62m max ) 
Well proportioned room with ensuite benefits from 
views out over the garden. Presented to a good 
standard to include well proportioned built-in 
storage. 
 
Ensuite 
5' 8" max x 4' 10" max ( 1.73m max x 1.47m max ) 
Again, well proportioned. Complete with curved 
shower cubicle, WC and basin/vanity. Obscured 
glass window to the rear aspect. 
 
Bedroom 2 
10'  max x 8' 8" max ( 3.05m max x 2.64m max ) 
Well proportioned room to the front aspect finished 
to a typically high standard as elsewhere. Pretty long 
views to the front aspect. 
 
Bedroom 3 
10'  max x 7' 6" max ( 3.05m max x 2.29m max ) 
Similar to Bedroom 2 offering pretty views to the 
front. This double room also offers great dimensions 
and finished to a high standard. 

 
Bedroom 4 
7' 6" max x 6' 6" max ( 2.29m max x 1.98m max ) 
The fourth and smallest room still offers good 
proportions. This offers flexibility and may be used 
as a nursery or home office for example. 
 
Bathroom 
5' 8" max x 5' 5" max ( 1.73m max x 1.65m max ) 
The well presented bathroom includes a bath with 
shower over, integrated WC and basin vanity, 
chrome towel rail and window to the side aspect. 
 
External 
Garden 
Maximum measurements of circa 44 feet by 29 feet. 
Complete with well maintained boundary fencing, 
attractive lawn and patio area to the house. Further 
benefiting from side access from the drive and 
further side door granting access into the garage. 
 
Driveway 
This runs alongside the house leading to the garage 
with dropped curb access from the street. Additional 
space for vehicles. 
 
Garage 
The stand alone garage measures an impressive 17ft 
9' max by 9ft 5' max and includes an up-and-over 
door to the front and side access door to and from 
the garden. The vaulted ceiling rises to circa 13 feet 
grants further high storage options should this be 
required. 
 



 

 

 

 

 

 



 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 0117 979 8082 

 
StokeGifford@allenandharris.co.uk 

 

41 North Road, Stoke Gifford, BRISTOL, BS34 

8PB 

 allenandharris.co.uk  

welcome to 

Railton Jones Close, 

Stoke Gifford Bristol 

• Attractive Four Bedroom Detached Home - NO CHAIN 

• Desirable Stoke Gifford Location / Four bedrooms / 

Ensuite / Additional WC 

• Driveway and Detached Garage 

• Kitchen/Diner and Living Room with Direct Garden 

Access 

• Council Tax Band D 
 

Tenure: Freehold EPC Rating: D 
 
 

 

  

£410,000 
 

 

 

Property Ref: 

STG109281 - 0003 

 

view this property online  allenandharris.co.uk/Property/STG109281 

1. MONEY LAUNDERING REGULATIONS Intending purchasers will be asked to produce identification documentation at a later stage and we 

would ask for your co-operation in order that there is no delay in agreeing the sale. 2. These particulars do not constitute part or all of an 

offer or contract. 3. The measurements indicated are supplied for guidance only and as such must be considered incorrect. Potential buyers 

are advised to recheck measurements before committing to any expense. 4. We have not tested any apparatus, equipment, fixtures or 

services and it is in the buyers interest to check the working condition of any appliances. 5. Where an EPC, or a Home Report (Scotland only) 

is held for this property, it is available for inspection at the branch by appointment. If you require a printed version of a Home Report, you 

will need to pay a reasonable production charge reflecting printing and other costs. 6. We are not able to offer an opinion either written or 

verbal on the content of these reports and this must be obtained from your legal representative. 7. Whilst we take care in preparing these 

reports, a buyer should ensure that his/her legal representative confirms as soon as possible all matters relating to title including the extent 

and boundaries of the property and other important matters before exchange of contracts. 

Allen & Harris  is a trading name of Sequence (UK) Limited which is registered in England and Wales under company number 4268443, Registered Office is Cumbria 

House, 16-20 Hockliffe Street, Leighton Buzzard, Bedfordshire, LU7 1GN.  VAT Registration Number is 500 2481 05.   

 


