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welcome to  

Coleshill Road, Birmingham 

***TRADITIONAL DETACHED HOUSE*** THREE BEDROOMS ***  TWO RECEPTION ROOMS *** SIDE GARAGE ***OFF ROAD PARKING***NO UPWARD 

CHAIN***DOWNSTAIRS GUEST WC *** POPULAR RESIDENTIAL LOCATION*** 

Approach 

Driveway to fore providing off road parking and 
giving access to side garage, raised lawn area 
enclosed by hedging. Step to front door opening 
into; 
 

Entrance Hallway 

Cupboard housing meters, central heating radiator, 
cupboard housing water tank, stairs rising to first 
floor landing and doors off to; 
 

Reception Room One 

15' 8" into the bay x 12' 9" max ( 4.78m into the bay x 

3.89m max ) 

Double glazed bay window to front elevation, 
central heating radiator, coving to ceiling. 
 

Reception Room Two 

16' 9" max x 11' 9" into chimney recess ( 5.11m max x 

3.58m into chimney recess ) 

Double glazed window and double doors to rear 
elevation and garden, two central heating radiators, 
gas fire, coving to ceiling. 
 

Kitchen 

9' 8" x 7' 9" ( 2.95m x 2.36m ) 

Range of matching wall and base units with roll 
edge work surfaces over incorporating single bowl, 
single drainer sink with mixer tap over. Integrated 
oven and four ring gas hob with extractor fan over. 
Under counter recess suitable for fridge and freezer. 
Part tiling to walls and splash back areas. Central 
heating radiator. Coving and spot lights to ceiling. 
Double glazed window to rear elevation.  Glazed 
door into garage. 
 

Garage 

28' 10" x 7' 4" ( 8.79m x 2.24m ) 

Double doors out to front driveway, double glazed 

window to rear elevation and double glazed door 
into garden. Wall mounted boiler, central heating 
radiator. 
 

Downstairs Guest Wc 

Opaque window to side elevation, Low level flush 
comfort height WC, vanity unit incorporating wash 
hand basin, tiling to splash back area, central heated 
towel rail, coving to ceiling. 
 

First Floor Laning 

Hatch to loft, opaque double glazed window to side 
elevation, doors off to; 
 

Bedroom One 

16' 2" into bay x 12'  to fitted wardrobe ( 4.93m into bay x 

3.66m to fitted wardrobe ) 

Double glazed bay window to front elevation, 
central heating radiator, fitted wardrobes to one 
wall, coving to ceiling. 
 

Bedroom Two 

11' 5" x 9' 9" to fitted wardrobe ( 3.48m x 2.97m to fitted 

wardrobe ) 

Double glazed window to rear elevation, central 
heating radiator, fitted wardrobes to one wall with 
mirrored sliding doors, coving to ceiling. 
 

Bedroom Three 

9' 9" x 9'  ( 2.97m x 2.74m ) 

Double glazed widow to rear elevation, central 
heating radiator, coving to ceiling. 
 

Bathroom 

Two opaque double glazed widows to side and front 
elevations, panelled bath, low level flush comfort 
height WC, pedestal wash hand basin, central 
heating radiator and heated towel rail, tiling to walls. 
 

Rear Garden 

Enclosed rear garden with block paved patio area, 
remainder mainly laid to lawn with mature shrubs, 
paneled fencing and hedges to boundaries, outside 
cold water tap, 
 



 

 

 

 

 

 



 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 0121 747 4722 

 
castlebromwich@shipways.co.uk 

 

258 Chester Road, Castle Bromwich, 

BIRMINGHAM, West Midlands, B36 0JE 

 shipways.co.uk  

welcome to 

Coleshill Road, 

Birmingham 

• TRADITIONAL DETACHED HOUSE 

• SIDE GARAGE (OFFERING SCOPE TO EXTEND OVER 

SUBJECT TO PLANNING) 

• THREE BEDROOMS 

• TWO RECEPTION ROOMS 

• OFF ROAD PARKING 
 

Tenure: Freehold EPC Rating: D 

Council Tax Band: D    

 
 
 

 

offers over  

£400,000 
 

 

 

 

 

 

Property Ref: 

CAB110336 - 0004 

 

view this property online  shipways.co.uk/Property/CAB110336 

1. MONEY LAUNDERING REGULATIONS Intending purchasers will be asked to produce identification documentation at a later stage and we 

would ask for your co-operation in order that there is no delay in agreeing the sale. 2. These particulars do not constitute part or all of an 

offer or contract. 3. The measurements indicated are supplied for guidance only and as such must be considered incorrect. Potential buyers 

are advised to recheck measurements before committing to any expense. 4. We have not tested any apparatus, equipment, fixtures or 

services and it is in the buyers interest to check the working condition of any appliances. 5. Where an EPC, or a Home Report (Scotland only) 

is held for this property, it is available for inspection at the branch by appointment. If you require a printed version of a Home Report, you 

will need to pay a reasonable production charge reflecting printing and other costs. 6. We are not able to offer an opinion either written or 

verbal on the content of these reports and this must be obtained from your legal representative. 7. Whilst we take care in preparing these 

reports, a buyer should ensure that his/her legal representative confirms as soon as possible all matters relating to title including the extent 

and boundaries of the property and other important matters before exchange of contracts. 

Shipways  is a trading name of Sequence (UK) Limited which is registered in England and Wales under company number 4268443, Registered Office is Cumbria House, 16-

20 Hockliffe Street, Leighton Buzzard, Bedfordshire, LU7 1GN.  VAT Registration Number is 500 2481 05.   

 


