
 

 

 

 

  

Fairway South, Wirral, CH62 3LG 

 

 

 

 



 
 

 

 

 

welcome to  

Fairway South, Wirral 
This two bed mid terrace house comes with uPVC double glazing and central heating. The property is located with easy reach of local amenities 

including the Croft Retail Park just a short walk away. Ideal for transport links the A41 is nearby with motorway links to both Chester and Liverpool. 

   

   



 

 

 

 
view this property online  jonesandchapman.co.uk/Property/BRO104973 

 

Property Description  
This two bed mid terrace house comes with uPVC 
double glazing and central heating. The layout 
comprises entrance hall, lounge, kitchen, two 
bedrooms and a bathroom. To the front of the 
property there is a garden mainly laid to lawn with 
shrubs and a driveway. The rear of the property 
offers a garden with plenty of space for outdoor 
furniture. The property is located with easy reach of 
local amenities including the Croft Retail Park just a 
short walk away. Ideal for transport links the A41 is 
nearby with motorway links to both Chester and 
Liverpool. 
 
Lounge  
14’ x 12' 2" (4.27m x 3.71m) 

Double glazed windows to the front, access through 
to kitchen. 
 

Kitchen 

17' 1" x 7' 11" (5.21m x 2.41m) 

Double-glazed window to rear, double-glazed door 
to side, fitted wall and base units, stainless steel 
inlayed sink unit, plumbing for automatic washing 
machine, wall mounted Combi boiler, part tiled walls. 
 

Bedroom One 

12' 3" x 9' 2" (3.73m x 2.79m) 

UPVC Double-glazed window to front, single radiator 
 

Bedroom 2 

10' 1" x 10' 5" (3.07m x 3.17m) 

UPVC Double-glazed window to rear, single radiator. 
 

Bathroom 

UPVC Double-glazed window to front, three piece 
suite comprising of, low level flush toilet, wash hand 
basin, panelled bath with overhead electric shower, 
tiled walls and floor, single radiator. 
 



 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 0151 334 2411 

 
Bromborough@jonesandchapman.co.uk 

 

29 Allport Lane Precinct, WIRRAL, Merseyside, 

CH62 7HH 

 jonesandchapman.co.uk  

welcome to 

Fairway South, Wirral 

 Mid Terrace House 

 Two Bedrooms 

 Located Close to all Amenities 

 Ideal First Time Buyers Home 

 Early Viewing is Advised 
 

Tenure: Freehold EPC Rating: C 
 

 

  

£140,000 
 

 

 

 

 

 

Please note the marker reflects the 

postcode not the actual property 

 

   

1. MONEY LAUNDERING REGULATIONS Intending purchasers will be asked to produce identification documentation at a later 

stage and we would ask for your co-operation in order that there is no delay in agreeing the sale. 2. These particulars do not 

constitute part or all of an offer or contract. 3. The measurements indicated are supplied for guidance only and as such must be 

considered incorrect. Potential buyers are advised to recheck measurements before committing to any expense. 4. We have not 

tested any apparatus, equipment, fixtures or services and it is in the buyers interest to check the working condition of any 

appliances. 5. Where an EPC, or a Home Report (Scotland only) is held for this property, it is available for inspection at the branch 

by appointment. If you require a printed version of a Home Report, you will need to pay a reasonable production charge reflecting 

printing and other costs. 6. We are not able to offer an opinion either written or verbal on the content of these reports and this 

must be obtained from your legal representative. 7. Whilst we take care in preparing these reports, a buyer should ensure that 

his/her legal representative confirms as soon as possible all matters relating to title including the extent and boundaries of the 

property and other important matters before exchange of contracts. 

Property Ref: 

BRO104973 - 0002 

 

see all our properties on zoopla.co.uk | rightmove.co.uk | jonesandchapman.co.uk 

view this property online  jonesandchapman.co.uk/Property/BRO104973 

 

 

 

 


