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Leamington Spa 

 
 



 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Grove Place 
Leamington Spa CV31 2AW 
 

for sale   offers over 

£290,000 

Property Description 

 

 

  

Two double bedroom property, each bedroom 
with its own en-suite private bathroom. 
Featuring a larger than average open plan 
lounge/kitchen/dining space with integrated 
appliances. 
Originally built in 1911 as a bakery, this 
Edwardian building has been tastefully 
converted into one of four contemporarily 
designed 3-storey town houses, completed in 
2019, this property is immaculately presented. 
 
 
Ground Floor 
 
Entrance Hallway 
With stairs rising to the first floor and a door 
leading to the open plan lounge/kitchen/diner. 
  
Lounge/Kitchen/Diner 
33' 7" x 11' 2" ( 10.24m x 3.40m ) 
The front door leads directly into the lounge 
area, a generous sized sliding sash timber 
double glazed window affronts the room. The 
house benefits from full underfloor heating to 
the ground floor, chestnut laminate floor is 
fitted throughout the space. The fully 
appointed modern white slab true handless 
kitchen stretches across the full width of the 
room and is equipped with an 80cm black 
glass Siemens 5-ring touch slide induction hob 
with extractor above, tower unit with AEG 
pyrolytic double oven plus a matching 
combination microwave, integrated Samsung 
fridge freezer, AEG integrated dishwasher & 
AEG washer dryer. The kitchen / dining area 
retains its original and impressive double 
height vaulted ceiling which is lit by oversized 
LED industrial lights.  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

First Floor 
 
Bedroom Two 
14' 9" x 8' 8" ( 4.50m x 2.64m ) 
This bedroom offers 12.5sq/m of space has a 
sliding sash timber double glazed window to 
the front aspect & features a fitted double 
wardrobe. Heating is provided by a single 
central heating radiator. 
 
En-Suite Shower Room 
Fitted with a low level WC, vanity unit wash 
basin, 800mm x 1200mm shower cubicle with 
bi-fold glass door enclosure& electric Triton 
shower. Centrally heated towel rail. The 
bathroom has two doors allowing it to be 
accessed from the landing for shared use, or 
with this door locked, it becomes configured 
as a private en-suite to the bedroom.  
 
Second Floor 
 
Bedroom One 
15'  x 9'  ( 4.57m x 2.74m ) 
This bedroom offers 12.5sq/m of space, has a 
large dormer sliding sash timber double 
glazed window to the front aspect & features 
a fitted double wardrobe. Heating is provided 
by a single central heating radiator. Double 
bed & mattress included. 
 
En-Suite Bathroom 
Fitted with a low level WC, vanity unit wash 
basin, P-shaped bath with glass side screen, 
overhead Triton thermostatic rain shower. 
Centrally heated towel rail. The bathroom has 
two doors allowing it to be accessed from the 
landing for shared use, or with this door 
locked, it becomes configured as a private en-
suite to the bedroom.  
 
Parking 
Non-permit on street parking spaces are 
available directly opposite the property on a 
first come first served basis. 
 
Agent's Note 
The property is currently tenanted with a 
monthly rental income of £1,600. The current 
tenant is due to vacate the property on 26th 
January 2026 
 



 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

To view this property please contact Connells on 

 

T 01926 881 441 
E leamingtonspa@connells.co.uk 
 

7-8 Euston Place    

LEAMINGTON SPA CV32 4LL 

 

 
 

 

 

 

Tenure: Freehold 

 

check out more properties at connells.co.uk 

 

 

1. MONEY LAUNDERING REGULATIONS Intending purchasers will be asked to produce identification documentation at a later stage and we would ask for your co-operation in order that there will be no delay in agreeing the sale. 2. These particulars do not constitute part or all of an offer or contract. 
3. The measurements indicated are supplied for guidance only and as such must be considered incorrect. Potential buyers are advised to recheck measurements before committing to any expense. 4. We have not tested any apparatus, equipment, fixtures, fittings or services and it is in the buyers 
interest to check the working condition of any appliances. 
 

Connells Residential is registered in England and Wales under company number 1489613, Registered Office is Cumbria House, 16-20 Hockliffe Street, Leighton Buzzard, Bedfordshire, LU7 1GN.  VAT Registration Number is 500 2481 05.   

See all our properties at www.connells.co.uk| www.rightmove.co.uk | www.zoopla.co.uk  Property Ref: SPA308843 - 0003 

EPC Rating: B Counci l  Tax 
Band: B    

  


