
Lavender Road, Sutton



Offers Over £450,000

• Modern Duplex Apartment

• Double Aspect Lounge with Juliet Balcony

• Fully Fitted Kitchen

• Three Bedrooms

• En-suite Shower Room To Master Bedroom

• Large Family Bathroom

• Secure Building With Entryphone System

• Communal Grounds and Gardens

• Allocated Parking Space

• Centrally Located For Sutton Town Centre

Leasehold

A stunning three bedroom duplex apartment situated
on the first floor of a modern and stylish purpose built
complex with direct views over Benhill Recreation
Ground, conveniently located for Sutton town centre.
Viewing Highly Recommended. 

This spacious split level apartment is a commuters
dream due to its central location close to the bustling
town of Sutton with transport links to central London
and variety of high street shops, pubs and restaurants.
This property would ideally suit a professional couple,
downsizer looking for a low maintenance 'lock-up and
leave' property, or a lucrative investment property.

The apartment is arranged over two floors with
original solid oak flooring throughout (excluding the

bathrooms) and consists of three good sized
bedrooms with wardrobes or access to eaves storage
space. There is a recently upgraded en-suite shower
room with underfloor heating and a large family
bathroom both fitted with matching modern sanitary
ware. 

The main living space is bright and spacious perfect
for dinning and entertaining guests with a Juliet
balcony which overlooks lush green parkland. The
separate kitchen is fitted with a matching range of
floor and wall mounted units with worktops and
integrated kitchen appliances and gas central heating
boiler system serviced in March. 

Outside the grounds are well maintained and there is

also an allocated car parking space and nearby there
is free on road parking for an additional car and
visiting guests.

Information - Leasehold
Length of Lease: 999 years from when the building
was built in 2003
Service Charge: £3573 in 2024 (this is an increase
from 2023 due to maintenance works the managing
agents are carrying out. Please contact us to discuss
details)
Ground Rent: None
Council Tax Band: D
EPC Rating: C










