
Hayes Road, Nuneaton, CV10 0NH



This is a rare opportunity to own this spacious
individual detached chalet style bungalow which
briefly accommodates entrance hall with staircase
to the first floor landing and leads to the spacious
lounge, dining room/bedroom four, kitchen with a
range of maple wood style eye and base level
units and a walk in pantry which houses the
Worcester combination boiler. Leading off the
kitchen is the side lobby and side entrance door.
Also on the ground floor is the master bedroom,
shower room comprising a corner shower cubicle
with incorporated shower unit, pedestal hand
wash basin and there is also a separate W.C.

The first floor landing has a double glazed
skylight and provides access to the two double
bedrooms with storage located to the eaves and
a family bathroom having a white coloured suite
comprising a panelled bath, pedestal hand wash
basin and a low level W.C. The property also
benefits from gas central heating a PVCu double
glazing.

Outside the front garden is planted with a variety
of shrubs and mini firs with path leading to the
front elevation and distance views over open
countryside. The rear garden is laid to pebble
stone and is planted with a variety of shrubs and
plants. There is also a paved patio area, green
house and shed located to the side of the
property. The garden is well maintained and is
enclosed by fencing overlooking a open green
space. The side garden is laid to paved patio with
a brick built store/outbuilding and side gate
providing access to the front elevation. There is
also a paved hardstanding accessed from the
rear which provides off road parking for vehicles
enclosed by fencing with incorporated double
gates. Also accessed from the rear elevation is
the detached brick built garage.

Internal viewing is highly recommended to fully
appreciate the accommodation on offer which is
also being offered for sale with no upward chain.
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Key Features

• Spacious Detached Chalet
Bungalow

• Spacious Lounge

• Dining Room/Bedroom Four

• Kitchen With Modern Units

• Three Bedrooms

• Ground Floor Shower Room &
W.C

• First Floor Bathroom

• GFCH & PVCu Double Glazing

• Gardens To Three Sides

• Large Garage & Off Road
Parking

£395,000

EPC Rating - D

Tenure - Freehold

Council Tax Band - D

Local Authority - 


