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Rushmore Terrace

A rare opportunity to purchase a 
very well presented 2-bedroom, 3-
story canal-side Victorian terrace 
house. 

Located at the end of a quiet cul-
de-sac and within easy reach of 
the town centre and train station. 

Thoughtfully improved by the 
current owner having a recently 
fitted modern kitchen and 
bathroom.

ENTRANCE HALL Welcoming 
entrance hallway with stairs rising 
to the first floor and door to the 
living / dining room. Comprising 
laminate flooring and a radiator.

KITCHEN Shaker style Kitchen 
with oak style worktops and tiling 
to the splash back areas. 
Integrated appliances include; an 
electric oven, electric hob with 
cooker hood over and dishwasher. 
Vinyl flooring, radiator, double 
glazed window to side elevation 
and a door to the courtyard 
garden.

BEDROOM ONE Two Velux 
windows, ceiling light point and 
radiator.

BEDROOM TWO UPVC window 
to front aspect overlooking canal 
aspects, ceiling light point and 
radiator.

BATHROOM Ceiling spotlights, 
tiled walls, heated towel rail and a 
suite comprising of: low level 
flush w.c., vanity unit and basin 
with mixer tap over, large shower 

cubicle with mixer shower.

OUTSIDE Gardens to front and 
rear of the property. Covered 
storage to rear.

Location
Leamington Spa

Royal Leamington Spa is a 
fashionable and elegant Regency 
town in the heart of 
Warwickshire. 

Renowned for its Victorian 
painted stucco villas and beautiful 
Regency houses, much of the 
charm of 19th- Century planning 
can still be found in and around 
the town. Today there is a great 
choice of high street and boutique 
shops, restaurants, cafes and bars, 
offering a unique shopping, dining 
and cultural experience. 

The river Leam runs through the 
town, and with its stunning 
architecture, tree-lined avenues, 
squares, parks and gardens, it is a 
very popular place to live.
 
Services
Mains water, electricity, drainage 
and telephone. 

Local Authority
Warwick District Council.

Viewing Arrangements
Strictly via the vendors sole 
agents Spa Estates on 01926 
754080. 

Website
www.spaestates.com

http://www.spaestates.com/
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