
GUIDE PRICE £1,750,000

The Penthouse, Burwalls Bridge Road, Leigh Woods, Bristol, BS8 3PD



Located moments away from the iconic Clifton Suspension Bridge and a short stroll from Clifton
Village, this exceptional penthouse represents one of Bristol’s finest offerings. Set within a
meticulously converted Grade II listed building, the residence boasts unparalleled city views.

Spanning approximately 2,526 sq ft, this luxurious three-bedroom penthouse showcases breathtaking
vistas that encompass the Clifton Suspension Bridge, Avon Gorge, and sweeping southern cityscapes
towards Lansdown. Accessible via an impressive communal hall with stairs and a lift, the entrance
hall sets a spacious tone with engineered wood flooring throughout most of the apartment.

The sunlit open-plan sitting/dining room features exposed wooden beams, cast-iron radiators, and a
gas fireplace, offering a welcoming ambiance. Adjoining is the kitchen with integrated Siemens
appliances, ample storage, and a dining area, leading seamlessly to a south-facing terrace boasting
views extending across Bristol toward Dundry and Lansdown.

The dual-aspect principal bedroom commands stunning views of the Suspension Bridge and Avon
Gorge, complemented by fitted wardrobes and a central fireplace. It includes a four-piece en-suite
with a freestanding roll top bath, separate shower, WC, and basin. Bedroom two enjoys similar
panoramic views and generous storage, while the third bedroom faces westward, providing ample
space. A stylish family bathroom with marble tiles, bath, separate shower, WC, and basin is accessible
from the entrance hall.

Completing this remarkable penthouse is a spacious terrace ideal for outdoor seating and al fresco
dining. ‘Burwalls House’ offers a truly unique setting amidst expansive private communal gardens
with lush lawns and mature trees, providing a serene retreat just half a mile from vibrant Clifton
Village.

This exceptional property also includes allocated off-road parking for two vehicles.

Location
Burwalls is beautifully situated close to Clifton Village and adjacent to the iconic Clifton Suspension
Bridge which spans the Avon Gorge. The site is located on Bridge Road about quarter of a mile from
Clifton Village and approximately 2.5 miles from Bristol City Centre. The building has its own
pedestrian access from Bridge Road and by car along the main estate driveway from Burwalls Road.
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• An Exceptional Penthouse Apartment In Grade II Listed
Building

• Moments Away From Clifton Suspension Bridge In Clifton

• 3 Bedrooms

• Modern Kitchen

• Open Plan Living/Dining Area

• Off-Road Parking for 2 Cars

• Terrace For Al Fresco Dining

• Views of Clifton Suspension Bridge & The Avon Gorge

£1,750,000
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