
John Thornycroft Road,
SOUTHAMPTON, SO19 9SW - £73,500



John Thornycroft Road
SOUTHAMPTON, SO19 9SW

***Shared Ownership 35%***Modern 2-bed
apartment in Woolston's Centenary Quay.
Features water views, balcony, communal
terrace, and secure parking. Near schools,
amenities, and transport. No chain.

***Shared Ownership 35%***Welcome to this 
exquisite two-bedroom apartment for sale on the 
second floor of the esteemed Centenary Quay 
development, located at Juno House, Woolston, 
SO19 9SW. This exceptional residence is perfectly 
positioned to offer breath-taking water views, 
enhancing the tranquil living experience it offers.

The apartment is designed with modern living in 
mind, featuring a spacious lounge/diner that leads 
out onto a private balcony, offering an idyllic spot 
for relaxation and entertaining. The kitchen is 
well-appointed with contemporary fixtures and 
fittings, and the home is completed with two 
generously sized bedrooms and a modern 
three-piece bathroom suite. For added comfort 
and convenience, the apartment benefits from 
electric heating, double glazing, and access to a 
communal roof terrace that boasts panoramic 
views of the surroundings. Additionally, residents 
will enjoy the security and convenience of an 
allocated under-croft parking space.



Council Tax Authority: Southampton City Council
Tenure: Leasehold
Energy Efficiency Rating: TBC

Located in Woolston, the apartment is nestled 
within the vibrant Centenary Quay development, a 
sought-after residential area known for its 
community spirit and stunning waterfront setting. 
The local area is abundant with amenities, 
including shops, cafes, and restaurants, catering 
to all your daily needs and leisure activities. 
Families will appreciate the proximity to reputable 
schools, making it an ideal home for professionals 
and families alike.

Transport links are excellent, with Woolston Train 
Station nearby, providing easy access to 
Southampton city centre and beyond. Additionally, 
the property is conveniently located for those 
commuting by car, with swift access to major 
motorways, including the M27, ensuring major 
cities along the south coast and London are within 
reach.

Offered for sale with no forward chain, this 
apartment represents a fantastic opportunity to 
live in a desirable location with the perfect blend of 
modern conveniences, natural beauty, and 
accessibility. Whether you're looking for a 
peaceful waterfront lifestyle or the convenience of 
city living, this property is sure to impress. No 
forward chain.
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IMPORTANT NOTICE: The details presented in these property particulars are believed to be precise, but they are intended to serve only as a general guide and must not

be regarded as a formal offer or contractual agreement. Prospective buyers should not depend on these details as accurate statements or depictions of reality but should

instead verify their correctness via their own inspections or other established means. We have not conducted an exhaustive survey, nor have we tested the utilities,

appliances, or particular fixtures. Room dimensions must not be relied upon for carpeting and furnishing decisions. The measurements provided are estimated.

No employee within Enfields has the power to make or offer any representation or guarantee about the property.




