
Bevois Valley Road, Bevois
SOUTHAMPTON, SO14 0TD - £165,000



Bevois Valley Road
BEVOIS, SOUTHAMPTON, SO14 0TD

This well-maintained two-bedroom top floor flat
on Bevois Valley Road offers a spacious
lounge/diner/kitchen, modern bathroom, and no
forward chain. Ideally located near local
amenities, schools, and excellent transport
links. Ready to move in!

Located on Bevois Valley Road, Bevois Valley, 
this two-bedroom top floor flat presents an 
excellent opportunity for those seeking a 
comfortable and convenient living space. The 
property is in very good condition and boasts a 
thoughtfully designed layout featuring a 
welcoming hallway, a spacious 
lounge/diner/kitchen area, two well-proportioned 
bedrooms, and a modern three-piece bathroom 
suite. With no forward chain, this flat is ready for 
immediate occupancy.

The Bevois Valley area is known for its vibrant 
community and diverse local amenities. 
Residents can enjoy a range of nearby shops, 
cafes, and restaurants, catering to a variety of 
tastes and preferences. For families, there are 
several reputable schools within close proximity, 
ensuring quality education options for children of 
all ages. Additionally, the flat's location provides 
easy access to parks and recreational facilities, 
perfect for outdoor activities and leisure.



Council Tax Authority: Southampton City Council
Tenure: Leasehold
Energy Efficiency Rating: C

Transport links are excellent, making this property 
an ideal choice for commuters. The nearest train 
station, St Denys, is just a short walk away, 
offering regular services to Southampton city 
centre, London, and other major destinations. For 
those who prefer to drive, the nearby M3 
motorway junction provides convenient access to 
the wider motorway network, facilitating travel to 
various parts of the country.

Living on Bevois Valley Road means benefiting 
from a thriving local community and a range of 
amenities, all while enjoying the comfort and 
convenience of this well-maintained flat. Whether 
you are a first-time buyer, a young professional, 
or looking to downsize, this property offers a 
fantastic opportunity to live in a sought-after area 
with excellent transport links and local facilities.
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IMPORTANT NOTICE: The details presented in these property particulars are believed to be precise, but they are intended to serve only as a general guide and must not

be regarded as a formal offer or contractual agreement. Prospective buyers should not depend on these details as accurate statements or depictions of reality but should

instead verify their correctness via their own inspections or other established means. We have not conducted an exhaustive survey, nor have we tested the utilities,

appliances, or particular fixtures. Room dimensions must not be relied upon for carpeting and furnishing decisions. The measurements provided are estimated.

No employee within Enfields has the power to make or offer any representation or guarantee about the property.




