
Sewall Highway, Coventry, CV2 3PA



Property
Description
Welcome to this duplex apartment
located in the sought-after area of
Wyken. This modernised property
boasts two bedrooms, perfect for a
starter home or professionals looking
for extra space. 

Upon entering, you are greeted by the
inviting entrance hallway, going
through to the lounge, offering ample
space for entertaining guests or simply
relaxing after a long day. The property
also features a modern, fully fitted
kitchen, well-appointed bathroom and
two double bedrooms.

One of the highlights of this duplex
apartment is the balcony area, where
you can enjoy your morning coffee or
unwind in the evening. The
modernisation throughout the property
adds a touch of elegance and style,
making it a truly inviting space to call
home.

Located in a popular area, you'll have
easy access to local amenities, schools,
and transport links, making it an ideal
choice for those looking for both
comfort and convenience.

Further benefits include: No Chain,
Electric Heating, New Boiler and Double
Glazing in the last 8 years.



Key Features 

• Two Bedrooms

• Duplex Apartment

• Modernised Throughout

• Fully Fitted Kitchen

• Balcony To Rear

• Spacious Lounge

• Modern Bathroom

• No Upwards Chain

• Surrounded By Local
Amenities

Offers Over
£130,000









Floorplan

EPC Rating - E

Tenure - Leasehold

Council Tax Band - A

Local Authority
Coventry City Council




