
Warren Road, Banstead
Offers In Excess Of £725,000



A beautifully presented three bedroom semi
detached home in the popular area of Nork, boasting

south facing garden, flexible accommodation and
being just moments from local amenities and the

station.



This well presented three bedroom semi
detached home offers flexible
accommodation throughout having
undergone significant extension on the
ground floor, creating three generous
reception rooms, downstairs bedroom /
study, utility room. downstairs shower room
with w/c, as well as the modern kitchen with
integral breakfast bar overlooking the
garden.

On the first floor there are three generously
sized bedrooms, a modern bathroom, as
well as a useful and large storage cupboard.

Outside there is a secluded south facing
rear garden, a real sun trap and perfect for
hosting, as well as a private driveway to the
front of the property for two to three cars.

Warren Road is an extremely popular
residential street in Nork, just a short
distance to Banstead station, Nork parade
along with the sought after Warren Mead
school.



Need to know

• Beautifully presented semi detached
home

• Three generous bedrooms

• Flexible accommodation

• Three receptions rooms and modern
kitchen with breakfast bar

• Downstairs shower room and utility
space

• Private driveway for parking

• South facing rear garden

• Close to the sought after Warren Mead
school

• Short distance to Banstead train station
and Nork parade

• Freehold

banstead@ralphjames.co.uk
01737 371 700

ralphjames.co.uk

Interested?


