
Ashworth Road
M A I D A  V A L E  •  £ 4 , 0 0 0 , 0 0 0



A semi detached five bedroom, arts

and crafts style house situated on one

of Maida Vale's most sought after

roads.

Five Bedrooms
Four Bathrooms
Off-Street Parking
c.2,832 Sq.Ft

DESCRIPT ION

Situated over c.2,832 Sq.Ft this is a fantastic example of how
a family home should be. Comprising five double bedrooms,
three en suite, an extra family bathroom as well as a further
two guest WCs You have ample entertaining space on the
ground floor with a kitchen/breakfast room, dinning room and
reception room all opening up onto the garden. In the
basement you have a large guest suite, utility room and family
room/tv room. On the upper floors you will find four large
double bedrooms and three more bathrooms.

Ashworth Road is located in the centre of Maida Vale, being
only 0.1m to Maida Vale Underground Station (Bakerloo Line)
0.5m to Warwick Avenue Underground (Bakerloo Line) and
0.9m to Paddington Station (Heathrow Express, National
Rain, London Underground). With a plethora of restaurants,
cafes, pubs and shops in the immediate area, it is perfect for
family living.

TERMS

Price: £4,000,000
Tenure: Freehold
Ground Rent:
Service Charge:
Local Authority: Westiminster
Council Tax: H
Energy Rating: 64.00





Jack Graham-Lindsey
Partner

0207 046 9464

jack.graham-lindsey@hardinggreen.com

Important Notice. We would like to inform prospective
purchasers that these sales particulars have been prepared as
a general guide only. A detailed survey has not been carried out,
nor the services, appliances and fittings tested. Room sizes
should not be relied upon for furnishing purposes and are
approximate. If floor plans are included, they are for guidance
only and illustration purposes only and may not be to scale. If
there are any important matters likely to affect your decision to
buy, please contact us before viewing the property.

FIND OUT MORE


