
£160,000 
Guide Price
Ratcliffe Court, Colchester



Guide Price: £160,000 - £170,000. 

Welcome to this well-presented first-floor 2-bedroom apartment
ideally situated to the north of Colchester, just off Ipswich Road.
Upon entering, you are greeted by an inviting entrance hall
adorned with two convenient storage cupboards, providing
ample space for everyday essentials.

The heart of the home unfolds into a spacious lounge seamlessly

connecting to the modern kitchen, creating a harmonious flow
perfect for both relaxation and entertainment. A delightful
Juliette balcony enhances the ambience, offering a charming
spot to enjoy the fresh air and scenic views.

Retreat to the principal bedroom, complete with built-in
wardrobes, providing practical storage solutions while
maintaining a clutter-free environment. The second bedroom
offers versatility, ideal for accommodating guests, setting up a

home office, or indulging in personal hobbies.

Completing the accommodation is a well-appointed family
bathroom, with the added benefit of underfloor heating, offering
comfort and convenience for daily routines.

Externally, residents can relish in the tranquil surroundings of
communal gardens, providing a serene escape from the hustle
and bustle of daily life. Additionally, allocated parking ensures
hassle-free parking arrangements, adding to the convenience
and ease of living in this desirable location.









Oakheart Colchester 
01206 803 308
colchester@oakheartproperty.co.uk
2b Cotman Road, Colchester, Essex, CO3 4QJ

Local Authority:
Colchester

Tenure:
Leasehold

Council Tax Band:
B

Agents Note: Whilst every care has been taken to prepare
these particulars, they are for guidance purposes only. All
measurements are approximate and are for general
guidance purposes only and whilst every care has been
taken to ensure their accuracy, they should not be relied upon.


