
Crowden Drive, Leamington Spa, CV32 6NX



Property
Description
A substantial five bedroom semi
detached three storey house offering
spacious and versatile family
accommodation being offered for sale
with no upward chain

The property is situated in a family
friendly private gated development in
North Leamington Spa and within the
catchments of good local schooling.

The accommodation comprises - Good
size entrance hall, cloak room/w.c,
living room, fantastic dining kitchen
with velux windows and direct access
to the rear garden.

On the first floor there are three
bedrooms, en-suite shower room and a
family bathroom, and to the second
floor two further bedrooms and a
further four piece bathroom. 

Outside there is driveway parking to
the front for two cars leading directly
to the garage, and to the rear the
garden is mainly laid to lawn with a
paved patio area.

The property is being sold with no
upward chain.



Key Features 

• Semi detached three storey
house

• Five bedrooms

• Sought after development in
North Leamington

• Large open plan
kitchen/dining room

• Living room

• Three bathrooms

• Garage and driveway

• Spacious and flexible
accommodation

• No Chain

Guide Price
£595,000



Entrance hall

Cloakroom/w.c

Living room
18'11" x 10'8"

Kitchen/dining room
18'1" x 14'6"

Bedroom
13'10" x 11'10"

En-suite shower room

Bedroom
10'9" x 10'0"

Bedroom
10'9" x 7'4"

Bathroom

Bedroom
15'6" x 10'9"

Bedroom
14'3" x 12'1"

En-suite bathroom

Garage
17'3" x 10'9"







Floorplan

EPC Rating - C

Tenure - Freehold

Council Tax Band - F

Local Authority
Warwick District Council

We routinely refer clients to both our recommended Legal Firm and a panel of Financial Services Providers. It is
your decision whether you choose to deal with these companies. In making that decision, you should know that we
receive a referral fee




