
High Street,

Bangor

1 Bed

Studio 

£199 Per Week



CONTACT

1 College Road
Bangor
Gwynedd
LL57 2AN

E: sales@varcityltd.com
T: 01248 719254
www.varcityliving.co.uk

• All bills included • Television included

• Digital TV package included • All double beds

• Fully managed property • Dishwasher

• Tumble dryer • Washing machine

Oren is a bright and modern luxury
apartment situated in 121 High Street,
Bangor. Fully-furnished and with modern
fittings throughout, Oren has everything you
need, along with integrated appliances and
laundry facilities. The apartment is furnished
with a bed, a desk and office chair and a
fully tiled wet room for the ultimate in luxury.
In addition, you will find a large kitchen
space featuring oven, hob and microwave,
as well as a 40” SMART TV located in the
bedroom. A great feature of this property is
that all bills are included. CCTV security and
door entry systems are also included, to
ensure the safety of our tenants. The
location of the property is fantastic, situated
close to supermarkets, all the perks of the
high street and only a short stroll from the
main University building. 23m2 in size, this
studio provides an occupant with plenty of
space for comfortable self-contained living.
For the 26/27 academic year, this property
has a dual occupancy fee of £20 per week.


