
 

 

 

 

  

Grace Edwards Close, Drayton Norwich NR8 6WB 

 

 

 

 



 
 

 

 

 

welcome to  

Grace Edwards Close, Drayton Norwich 

**CUL-DE-SAC LOCATION** The property is situated on a corner plot in a quiet cul-de-sac location ideal for growing families and benefits from 

UPVC double glazed windows, gas central heating and is close to local amenities, schools, public transport, the city centre and the NDR. 

   

   



 

 

 

 
view this property online  williamhbrown.co.uk/Property/HEL102886 

 

Entrance Hall 
Front entrance door, radiator, staircase to first floor 
landing. 
 

Cloakroom 

Fitted with a two piece suite comprising WC, wash 
hand basin, tiled splashbacks, radiator, UPVC double 
glazed side window. 
 

Lounge 

15' 2" x 11' 8" ( 4.62m x 3.56m ) 

UPVC double glazed front windows, under stair 
storage cupboard, fire place with surround and 
hearth, radiator, double doors to dining room. 
 

Dining Room 

10' 6" x 8' 5" ( 3.20m x 2.57m ) 

UPVC double glazed French doors to the rear 
garden, radiator, opening onto kitchen. 
 

Kitchen 

10' 10" x 6' 8" ( 3.30m x 2.03m ) 

Newly fitted with a matching range of base, wall and 
drawer units, sink unit and drainer with Quooker hot 
tap, built in electric oven with a five ring gas hob and 
cooker hood over,, plumbing for washing machine, 
built in slim-line dishwasher, UPVC double glazed 
rear window. 
 

First Floor Landing 

UPVC double glazed side window, airing cupboard, 
access to loft space and doors to: 
 

Bedroom One 

9' 8" x 9' 6" ( 2.95m x 2.90m ) 

UPVC double glazed front window, over stairs 
storage cupboard, radiator, door to en-suite. 
 

En-Suite 

Fitted with a three piece suite comprising shower 
cubicle, WC, wash hand basin, radiator, tiling, UPVC 
double glazed front window. 
 

Bedroom Two 

10' 2" x 8' 1" ( 3.10m x 2.46m ) 

UPVC double glazed rear window, radiator. 
 

Bedroom Three 

10' 5" x 8' 7" ( 3.17m x 2.62m ) 

UPVC double glazed rear window, radiator. 
 

Bathroom 

Fitted with a three piece suite comprising jacuzzi 
bath with shower over, WC, wash hand basin, head 
towel rail, tiling, UPVC double glazed side window. 

 

Outside 

To the front of the property there is an access 
pathway to front door leading onto the driveway and 
a brickweave area for additional parking. The garage 
has an up and over front door, door to the rear, 
power, light and an electric car charging port. To the 
rear of the property there is a low maintenance 
garden which is mainly laid to lawn with a patio. 
 



 

 

 

 

directions to this property:  

 
Leave our Hellesdon Office on the Reepham Road heading out 

of Hellesdon towards Drayton. At the roundabout continue 

straight over continuing on the Reepham Road. Take the 

second left onto Longdale and follow the road to the end, then 

turn left on to Felsham Way. Follow the road round to the left 

onto Grace Edwards Close then turn right at the end of the 

road. Follow the road to the end of the cul-de-sac where the 

property will be on your left. 

1. MONEY LAUNDERING REGULATIONS Intending purchasers will be asked to produce identification documentation at a later stage and we 

would ask for your co-operation in order that there is no delay in agreeing the sale. 2. These particulars do not constitute part or all of an offer 

or contract. 3. The measurements indicated are supplied for guidance only and as such must be considered incorrect. Potential buyers are 

advised to recheck measurements before committing to any expense. 4. We have not tested any apparatus, equipment, fixtures or services and 

it is in the buyers interest to check the working condition of any appliances. 5. Where an EPC, or a Home Report (Scotland only) is held for this 

property, it is available for inspection at the branch by appointment. If you require a printed version of a Home Report, you will need to pay a 

reasonable production charge reflecting printing and other costs. 6. We are not able to offer an opinion either written or verbal on the content 

of these reports and this must be obtained from your legal representative. 7. Whilst we take care in preparing these reports, a buyer should 

ensure that his/her legal representative confirms as soon as possible all matters relating to title including the extent and boundaries of the 

property and other important matters before exchange of contracts. 

William H Brown  is a trading name of Sequence (UK) Limited which is registered in England and Wales under company number 4268443, Registered Office is Cumbria 

House, 16-20 Hockliffe Street, Leighton Buzzard, Bedfordshire, LU7 1GN.  VAT Registration Number is 500 2481 05.   

 

 01603 487888 

 
hellesdon@williamhbrown.co.uk 

 

303 Reepham Road, Hellesdon, NORWICH, 

Norfolk, NR6 5AD 

 williamhbrown.co.uk  

welcome to 

Grace Edwards Close, Drayton Norwich 

• Link-Detached Family Home 

• Three Bedrooms 

• Cloakroom, En-Suite & Family Bathroom 

• Garage with Electric Car Charging Port & Driveway 

Parking 

• Enclosed Rear Garden 
 

Tenure: Freehold EPC Rating: Awaited 
 

 

 

  

£335,000 
 

 

 

 

 

 

Please note the marker reflects the 

postcode not the actual property 

   

Property Ref: 

HEL102886 - 0003 

 

view this property online  williamhbrown.co.uk/Property/HEL102886 

 

 


